City of Sioux Falls Council Meeting
M nut es
Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street

REGULAR MEETI NG OF Tuesday, March 6, 2018, at 7 PM

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT OFFI Cl AL AGENDA
PRESENT ABSENT
Council Menber Christine M Erickson
Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach
Counci| Menber Rick Kiley
Counci| Menber Greg Neitzert
Mayor M ke T. Huet her
Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing
Counci| Menber Marshall Sel berg
Council Menber Pat Starr
Counci| Menber Theresa Stehly

I NVOCATI ON

Pastor Kirk Thorson, Living Wrd Free Lutheran Church

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE
PROCLANMATI ONS

Wonen in Constructi on Week - March 4-10, 2018

Spread the Wrd to End the Wrd - March 7, 2018

Si oux Enpire Water Festival Days - March 13 and 14, 2018

RECOGNI TI ON/ AWARDS

SI QUXPERHERO Citi zen Recognition Awards

The SI QUXPERHERO Citizen Recognition Awards were presented to:

Laurie



Fluit, Angela DeClerk, Cair Hal verson, Jayne Nel son, and Tessica
Severson

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS
APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Counci
Menber Christine M Erickson to approve the Consent Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Rick Kiley, Geg
Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, 7.
Noes, 0. Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach was absent for the vote on

this item

Mot i on Passed.
M NUTES

I nformati onal Meeting of Tuesday, February 20, 2018, at 4 p.m

City Council Meeting of Tuesday, February 20, 2018, at 7 p.m

I nformati onal Meeting of Tuesday, February 27, 2018, at 4 p.m

Joint City Council/M nnehaha County Conmmi ssion Meeting of Tuesday,
*  February 27, 2018, at 5:30 p.m

COVMUNI CATI ONS
1. Approval of contracts/agreenents on the March 2, 2018, neno.

2. Approval of the notice of change orders on theMarch 2, 2018,
neno.

Conmmruni cati on was received fromthe Sioux Falls Irish Cub requesting

3. permission to consune, but not sell, beer and wine at the Avera Prairie
Center, 1000 E. 23rd St., on March 16, 2018, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5, for
a reception to honor the 2018 St. Patrick’s Day Parade Grand Marshall.

Commruni cati on was received fromthe Butterfly House & Aquarium requesting

4, pernission to consune, but not sell, wine and nalt beverages at the
Butterfly House & Aquarium 4320 S. Oxbow Ave. on March 22, from5 p.m - 6:
30 p.m, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5, for hosting a | eadership m xer

Conmmmuni cati on was received fromthe Siouxland Heritage
Museunsr equesti ng perm ssion to consune, but not sell, beer and

5. wineat the A d Courthouse Miseum 200 W Sixth St. on April 6, 2018
from5 p.m - 7 p.m, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5, for an exhibit opening
reception.

Commruni cation received fromthe Unity Lodge #130, A F. & A M, requesting

6. permi ssion to consune, but not sell, beer and wine at 520 S. First Ave. on
April 28, 2018, between 11 a.m and 5 p.m, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5, for a
"Wne and Canvas" style event.

Conmmruni cation received fromthe Unity Lodge #130, A F. & A M,



7. requesting pernission to consune, but not sell, beer and wine at 520 S.
First Ave. on May 10, 2018, between 11 a.m and 5 p.m, pursuant to SDCL 35-
1-5.5, for an awards dinner.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 15, 2018; 11, 250

8. @llons each Dyed Diesel #1 & #2 ;Stern Ol ($2.3185/ DWWl & $1.9985/
DM#2); M dway Service, Cole s Petroleum Harns G, Howes Ql, CHS, Inc.,
andd son OGl: Al no bid. Bid awarded to: Stern Q.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 21, 2018; 8,950 Gallon
s of

unl eaded and 350 Gall ons of 50/50 blend; Mdway Service ($2.0037 for

8, 5000f unl eaded, $2.0700 for 450 of unleaded and $2.2600 for 350 of
9. 50/50 blend); Cole's Petroleum ($2.0156 for 8,500 gallons of unleaded - no bi
d on

other);Stern Ol ($2.1225 for 8,500 of unl eaded, $2.2025f or 450 of

unl eaded and $2.6476 for 3500f 50/50 blend Harms G|, Howes QG l, CHS,

Inc., and Ason G, all no bid.Bid awarded to: M dway Servi ce.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 22, 2018; #1 and #2

Clear Diesel; 7,500 Gallons; CHS, Inc. (#1 dear Diesel $2.585 and #2 C ear
10. Diesel $2.345); Harnms Ol (#1 dear Diesel $2.571 and #2 C ear Diesel

$2.3476); Howes O I, and Mdwest G I, both no bid.Bid awarded to:

Harms Q| .

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 23, 2018; 7,500 Gallo
ns
of Dyed Diesel # 1 and 7,500 Gallons of Dyed Diesel # 2;Cole’s
11. Petroleum (%$2.3650 for Dyed Diesel # 1 and $2.1075 for Dyed Diesel #
2);Stern Ol: ($2.2868 for Dyed Diesel # 1 and $2.1026 for Dyed Diesel #
2); Mdway Service, Harnms Ol, Howes Ol, CHS, Inc.,and Ason GI, all
no bid.Bid awarded to: Stern QO I.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 26, 2018; 8,500 Gallo
ns
12. of Unl eaded; M dway Service ($2.0685); Cole's Petrol eum ($2.0782); Stern

Ol (%$2.1353); Harns OIl, Howes Gl, CHS, Inc. and Ason GIl, allno bid.

Bi d awarded to: M dway Servi ce.

APPLI CATI ONS

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for

13. Catering America, Chef Dominique's Catering to be operated at the Ad
Court house Museum 200 West 6th Street, for a wedding reception on Cctober
6, 2018.

The foll owi ng abatenents were recommended for approval by the Director of
Equal i zati on and deened legally sufficient by the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for
M nnehaha County and the City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

City of Sioux Falls, 224 West Ninth Street, Parcel # 28629, for 2017
14. property taxes in the anount of $164.38. Reason: Property is exenpt from
t he tax.

15. City of Sioux Falls, 224 Wst Ninth Street, Parcel 37583, for 2017 property
taxes in the amobunt of $107.29. Reason: Property is exenpt fromthe tax.

16. City of Sioux Falls, 224 Wst Ninth Street, Parcel 37584, for 2017 property
taxes in the amobunt of $180.64. Reason: Property is exenpt fromthe tax.



17.

18.

Sout h Dakota Departnent of Transportation, 700 E. Broadway Avenue, Pierre,
SD, Parcel 44201, for 2017 property taxes in the anpount of $818.84. Reason
property is exenpt fromthe tax.

Sout h Dakota Departnent of Transportation, 700 E. Broadway Avenue, Pierre,
SD, Parcel # 44202, for 2017 property taxes in the anount of $1,552.24.
Reason: property is exenpt fromthe tax.

Itens 19 through 24: The anpunt requested is the difference between the elderly
freeze and the non-elderly freeze.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24,

Berton Perrynman, 6201 W Essex Drive, Parcel 51850, for 2017 property taxes
in the anount of $292.82.

Carol e Pagones, 3612 S. Bahnson, Parcel #59354, for 2017 property taxes in
the anount of $457.109.

David Larson, 822 North Spring, Parcel 39381, for 2017 property taxes in
the anount of $942. 36.

Duane Ness, 1224 East 6th Street, Parcel #38395, for 2017 property taxes in
the anount of $253.44.

Marlin Erickson, 1708 South Ester Drive, Parcel #36235, for 2017 property
taxes in the anount of $267.00.

Charlotte Hanson, 3608 E. 24th Street, Parcel # 36198, for 2017 property
taxes in the anount of $272.49.

The foll owi ng abatenents were recomended for denial by the Director of
Equal i zat i on:

25.

26.

Char Roth, 709 N. Blue Bell Lane, Parcel #86828, for 2017 taxes in the
amount of $2, 335.49. Reason: Equalization did not receive an owner
occupi ed application for this taxpayer

Charles Geurts, 7808 W Vista Park Street, Parcel #86746, for 2017
property taxes in the anount of $1,090.28. Reason: Equalization did
not receive an owner occupied application for this taxpayer

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, March 20, 2018, at 7 p.m for ltens 27-29

27.

28.

29.

New 2017-18 Package Malt Beverage License for Bwengbugal WMatenbera &
Cynthia Yeanay, o Mni Market, 1300 West 12th Street (CUP not required).

Transfer of 2017-18 Package Malt Beverage License from Bereni se Garci a-
Navarett & Al berto Carranza, M Casa Latina Mexican Store, 809 South Marion
Road, to M Casa Latina Mexican Store LLP, M Casa Mexican Store, 809 South
Mari on Road (CUP not required).

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Sioux Falls Cyclones Inc., to be
operated at Riverdale Park, 2000 East 24th Street, for a fundraiser run on
April 7, 2018.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA



A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to approve the Regul ar Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

PUBLI C | NPUT

Heat her Pastor spoke about being honel ess.

Bruce Dani el son spoke about the "Strong Towns" presentation held this
weekend.

Ni ck Weil and spoke about noi se deci bel standards in the downtown area.

Scott Ehrisman spoke about noi se deci bel standards; soundproofing requirenents;
asking questions in public settings; |awsuits against local builders; and
requirenents for placenent on election ballots.

M ke Yaeger spoke about noi se deci bel standards in the downtown area.

Si erra Broussard spoke about expressing support for downtown businesses and
about noi se deci bel standards in the downtown area.

Jeff Hazard spoke about the Sioux Falls noise ordinances in conparison to other
cities; the inpacts and effects of hearing |oss on an individual; and the noise
deci bel standards in the downtown area

Davi d Zokaites spoke about his forner canpaign for Mayor of Sioux Falls.

Chri st opher Rei stroffer spoke about the noi se decibel standards in the downtown
area and about the culture in the downtown area.

Il eana Perez spoke about the Icon Lounge hosting Latino events during the nonth
and about the noi se decibel standards in the downtown area.

Jacob Carnel etti spoke about the noise decibel standards in the downtown area
and about living in the downtown area.

Ell ory Krieger spoke about supporting the Icon Lounge and living in the
downt own ar ea

WIl WIcox spoke about living in the downtown area and enforcing the
ordi nances regarding noi se deci bel standards.

Robert G egerscheck spoke about the future of listening to nusic in the
downt own ar ea

Matt hew M ka spoke about the inpact an ordi nance change woul d have on ot her
nmusic, arts, and entertai nnent venues in the city.

Xavi er Pastrano spoke about the changes in downtown Sioux Falls and about |oca
venues boosting the | ocal econony.

Jesse Rierson spoke about enforcenent by Animal Control; the city ordinances
regardi ng exotic pets; and the ordinances restricting the nunber of pets and
owner can have



Jarod Kinball spoke about enforcenent by Aninmal Control and the city ordinances
regardi ng exotic pets.

Ti m St anga spoke about the noi se deci bel standards downt own and whet her or not
any ordi nance changes will be city w de.

Jarod Ponranky spoke about conplaints coning as a result of nmuch | ouder venues
vs. the regular type of nusic venues.

Kyl e Rogers spoke about a recap of noise deci bel standards that were di scussed
by previous speakers.

Ni ck Di nsnore spoke about the cultural benefits of living in Sioux Falls.

Adam El | sworth spoke about controlling decibel levels within a facility and
requesting an anal ysis be done on the baseline decibels in the downtown areas.

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS

Transfer of 2018 Retail Wne License from Max Nguyen, Nails Art, 5012 South
30. Adiff Avenue, to Nails Art LLC, Nails Art, 5012 South diff Avenue, with
Conditional Use Permt (2014-09-03) being approved on Cctober 1, 2014.

Transfer of 2017-18 Retail Malt Beverage License, with video lottery

termnals, from Nel son Qperating Conpany, Friday’'s Hero, 1004 West 18th
31. Street, to Nelson Operating Conpany, Northstar Gill & Pub, 4305 Wst 61st

Street North (full service restaurant; CUP not required). Pending

final inspections per Fire, Health and Buil di ng Services.

New 2018 Retail Wne License for Nel son Qperating Conpany, Northstar Gill
32. & Pub, 4305 West 61st Street North (full services restaurant; CUP not

required). Pending final inspections per Fire, Health and Buil ding

Servi ces

33. New 2018 Retail Wne License for Shop Dog LLC, Shop Dog, 5015 South Western
Avenue, Suite 130 (CUP not required).

New 2017-18 Retail Malt Beverage License for Myers LLC, Myers Deli, 221
34. South Phillips Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final inspections
per Health.

35. New 2018 Retail Wne License for Myers LLC, Myers Deli, 221 South Phillips
Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per Health.

New 2018 Package Li quor License for Shenanigan’s Pub Inc., Shenanigan' s Spor
ts Bar
36. & Gill, 1903 South Ellis Road (CUP not required; this is an addition to an
existing license).
Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
37. Stockyards Ag Experience, 300 East Falls Park Drive, for a Young
Prof essional's Network event on March 8, 2018.
Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Catering
38. Anerica, Chef Dominique's Catering to be operated at Dakota Dental, 208 West

37th Street, for a retirenent open house on March 22, 2018.



Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Senior
39. Citizens Services to be operated at Active CGenerations, 2300 West 46th
Street, for fundraiser events on March 22 and April 29, 2018.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for

40. Westward Ho Country Club Inc., The Country Club of Sioux Falls to be
operated at Great Western Bank, 225 South Main Avenue, for a Chanber M xer
on April 10, 2018.

41. Special One-Day Liquor License for Butterfly House & Aquarium 4320 South
Oxbow Avenue, for a fundraiser on April 20, 2018.

Special One-Day Wne License for Siouxland Heritage Miseuns to be operated
42. at Pettigrew Hone & Miuseum 131 North Duluth Avenue, for History Happy Hour
on April 26 and August 30, 2018.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Sisters of the Presentation of
43. the Blessed Virgin Mary to be operated at Falls Park, 305 East Falls Park
Drive, for a fundraiser on May 12, 2018.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Sioux
44, Falls Area Conmmunity Foundation to be operated at Sanford | nagenetics, 1321
West 22nd Street, for a fundraiser on May 3, 2018.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Siouxland Heritage Miseuns to be
45, operated at Pettigrew Hone & Museum 131 North Duluth Avenue, for History
Happy Hour on May 24, 2018.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Sioux
46. Falls Jazz & Blues Society to be operated at Yankton Trail Park, 3901 South
M nnesot a Avenue, for JazzFest on July 20 and 21, 2018.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to approve Itens 30 through 46.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.
| NTRODUCTI ON AND ADOPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG

PROPERTY LOCATED AT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF W BENSON RD. AND |-29 FROM THE
| -
47. 1 LIGHT I NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT TO THE G4 COWERCI AL- REG ONAL DI STRICT, PETITIO

NO. 7972-2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG VAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FAL
LS.
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to adopt said Odinance No. 15-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.



2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG

PROPERTY LOCATED AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF E. 18TH ST. AND S. DARRYL PL.
48. FROM THE C-2 COMMERCI AL- NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR DI STRICT TO THE G

3 COWMERCI AL- COWUNI TY DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 7973-2018, AND AMENDI NG THE

OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssion

recommends approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Marshal | Sel berg to adopt said Odinance No. 16-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 5600 W UNI VERSITY TRL. FROM THE RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX

49. RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRI CT TO THE PEDESTRI AN- ORI ENTED PLANNED UNI' T
DEVELOPMENT DI STRICT, PETI TION NO. 7975-2018, AND AVENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance No. 17-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 3015 S. M NNESOTA AVE. FROM THE C-3 COMMVERCI AL- COMMUNI TY

50. DISTRICT TO THE G4 COMVERCI AL- REG ONAL DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 7978-2018, AN

AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anning
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said O dinance No. 18-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF W 12TH ST. AND S. MARION RD. FR

51. THE I-1 LIGHT I NDUSTRIAL AND C-3 COMVERCI AL- COWUNI TY DI STRI CTS TO THE | -
1 LIGHT I NDUSTRI AL AND C-3 COMVERCI AL- COWLUNI TY DI STRI CTS, PETI TION NO. 7980

2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl ann
i ng
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (8-0).



A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said O dinance 19-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG
PROPERTY LOCATED EAST OF N. WESTPORT AVE AND SOQUTH OF W 54TH ST. N. FROM

52. THE AG ACRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO THE S-2 | NSTI TUTI ONAL CAMPUS PLANNED UNI'T
DEVELOPMENT DI STRICT, PETI TION NO. 7981-2018, AND AVENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to adopt said O dinance No. 20-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE
CODE OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 30: CI TY COUNCI L,

53. SUBCHAPTER ORGANI ZATI ON AND PROCEDURE, BY ADDI NG SUBSECTI ON (b) TO SECTI ON
30. 029 TO REQUI RE DELI VERY OF ANY NOTI CES OF I NTENT TO SUE TO THE CI TY
COUNCI L.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Theresa Stehly to adopt said O dinance No. 21-18.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Theresa Stehly to anend by adding "and any lawsuit filed in circuit court
against the City of Sioux Falls" at the end of subsection (b). The

anended sentence would read: "The city attorney shall deliver to the city
council, within seven days of its receipt, a copy of any notice of intent to
sue which is received by the city pursuant to SDCL 3-21 and any lawsuit filed
in circuit court against the city of Sioux Falls."

Vote to anend: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,

7. Noes, Rex Rolfing, 1.

Mbti on Passed.

Vote to adopt, as anended: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle
Er penbach, Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 7. Noes, Rex Rolfing, 1.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, March 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 54:

54. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, DECLARI NG
CERTAI N REAL PROPERTY OF THE CI TY SURPLUS AND APPROVI NG OFFER TO PURCHASE.



A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
March 13, 2018, at 7 p.m for |tem 54,

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle
Er penbach, Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr,
Theresa Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, March 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 55:

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AUTHORI ZI NG
THE MAYOR TO ENTER | NTO A DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CI TY OF SI OUX
55. FALLS AND BEDROCK DEVELCPMENT, LLC, ALONG W TH OTHER DOCUMENTS, AMENDMENTS,
OR OTHER | NSTRUVENTS AS MAY BE DEEMED NECESSARY AND APPROPRI ATE CONSI STENT
W TH THE DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT.
A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci|l Menber Greg Neitzert to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, March 13, 2018, at 7 p.m for Item55.
Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle
Er penbach, Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr,
Theresa Stehly, 8. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.
HEARI NGS AND RESCLUTI ONS

56. A RESOLUTION OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
DALCO ADDI TI ON.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Resol ution No. 22-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 22-18

A RESOLUTI ON OF THE CI TY OF SI OUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
[ DALCO ADDI TI ON ].

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That the prelinmnary plan of [Dalco Addition ] tothe City of Sioux Falls,
[Lincoln ] County, SD, is hereby approved, and the Gty derk of
the City of Sioux Falls is hereby directed to endorse on such plan a copy of
this resolution and certify the sane thereon.

Dat e adopted: 03/06/18 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor



ATTEST:
Thomas M Greco
Cty derk

57. A RESOLUTION OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
NORTH RI DGE ADDI TI ON.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menber Marshall Sel berg to adopt said Resolution No. 23-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 23-18

A RESCLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
[ NORTH RI DGE ADDI Tl OV] .

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD:
That the prelinmnary plan of [North Ridge Addition] to the City of Sioux Falls,
[Lincoln ] County, SD, is hereby approved, and the Gty derk of
the City of Sioux Falls is hereby directed to endorse on such plan a copy of
this resolution and certify the sane thereon.
Dat e adopted: 03/06/18 .
M ke T. Huet her
Mayor
ATTEST:
Thomas M Greco
Cty derk

A RESOLUTI ON AUTHORI ZI NG THE MAYOR TO ENTER | NTO AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE Cl
TY
58. OF SI QUX FALLS AND GREAT BEAR RECREATI ON PARK, | NC. FOR THE MANAGEMENT OF TH
E

GREAT BEAR RECREATI ON PARK (" GREAT BEAR'), | NCLUDI NG AN ALPI NE SKI I NG

FACI LI TY, GREAT BEAR LODGE, AND ALL OTHER GREAT BEAR FACI LI TI ES.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Christine M Erickson to adopt said Resolution No. 24-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg, Pat Starr, Theresa
Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 24-18



A RESCLUTI ON AUTHORI ZI NG THE MAYOR TO ENTER | NTO AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CI TY
OF SI QUX FALLS AND GREAT BEAR RECREATI ON PARK, | NC. FOR THE MANAGEMENT OF THE
GREAT BEAR RECREATI ON PARK (" GREAT BEAR'), | NCLUDI NG AN ALPI NE SKI | NG FACI LI TY,
GREAT BEAR LODGE, AND ALL OTHER GREAT BEAR FACI LI TI ES.

WHEREAS, the City of Sioux Falls (the "City") and G eat Bear Recreation Park,
Inc. (the "Manager") find that it is in the best interest of the people of the
city of Sioux Falls, the Manager, and Great Bear that an Agreenent be continued
between the City and Manager, whereby the Manager shall continue to operate,
manage, maintain, plan, and devel op Great Bear Recreation Park, including the
Al pine skiing facility owned by the Cty and nanagenent of a year-round public
use of the Great Bear |odge and all other Great Bear facilities; and

VWHEREAS, by virtue of its purpose and interests, the Manager is best qualified
to the overall nmanagenent and operation of Great Bear Recreation Park; and

WHEREAS, the Manager and the City find that it is in both parties’ best
interests that a five-year contract be now executed and subsequently entered

i nto;

If there aren’t any "WHEREAS" phrases, skip "NON THEREFORE' and begin with
just "BE I T RESOLVED..."NOW THEREFORE, BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI OUX
FALLS, SD:

That the docunents attached to and part of this resolution entitled "Managenent
Agreenment for Operation of Great Bear Recreation Park," being a five-year
agreenent for the Manager to manage the Great Bear Recreation Park, is hereby
appr oved.

That the Mayor is authorized to sign such Agreenent after it is ratified and
execut ed by the Manager.

Dat e adopted: 03/06/18 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Thomas M Greco

Cty derk

REPORT OF OFFI CERS/ BOARDS/ COVM TTEES/ TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRI ATl ON
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS W THI N A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI T AS PROVI DED

IN THE SI OQUX FALLS C TY CHARTER SECTI ON 5. 07(d)

59. REPORT OF THE MARCH 2, 2018, NOTI CE OF TRANSFER OF APPROPRI ATI ONS W THI N
MAJOR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI TS.

ADJ OURNMENT
A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber M
i chel | e Erpenbach to adjourn the neeting at 9: 37

p. m

Council Chair Rick Kiley called for a voice vote, all nmenbers voted
yes.



Mbti on Passed.
Tamara Jorgensen, MVC
Assistant City Oerk

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE: UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE
PROVI DED FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TI ES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERK' S

OFFI CE, CARNEG E TOWN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD)
24 HOURS | N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE CI TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCI L WLL ACT AS A DEC SI ON- MAKER ON AN

UPCOM NG MATTER I NVOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO
PROVI DE WRI TTEN COMMENTS TO THE ENTIRE CI TY COUNCIL OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COMMENT
AT THE PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM IS CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY

COUNCI L. THOSE WHO PROVI DE COMVENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT

THEI R COMMENTS MAY BECOVE PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EW BY
ALL PARTIES AND THE PUBLI C.

ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE
M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE
LIMTED TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETINGS ON CI TYLI NK: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGS

AR LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COW TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE
THE FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MMEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE
I NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NG CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS AR LI'VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M THE JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5
P.M REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCHI VED AND AVAI LABLE

FOR VI EW NG ON DEMAND AT WAN SI QUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NG S

VI DEO ARE POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING CITY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLCSE CAPTI ONED ON CI TYLI NK.

CI TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGS, COWM TTEE MEETI NGS, AND

CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON FRI DAYS AND SATURDAYS. JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS ON FI RST FRI DAY AND SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETING GO TO
"ClI TYLI NK" AT WAW SI QUXFALLS. ORG FOR SPECI FI C PROGRAMM NG TI MES.



