

City Council Meetings
7/8/2014 7:00:00 PM

SIRE Meeting Contents

INVOCATION

Senior Pastor Randall Gehring, Our Savior's Lutheran Church

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

PROCLAMATIONS

RECOGNITION/AWARDS

VISITOR RECOGNITION

CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

MINUTES

Informational Meeting of Tuesday, July 1, 2014, at 4:00 p.m.

Regular City Council Meeting of Tuesday, July 1, 2014, at 7:00 p.m.

COMMUNICATIONS

Approval of contracts/agreements on the July 3, 2014 memo.

Notice of change orders on the July 3, 2014 memo.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: June 26, 2014 Unleaded Ethanol & E85 5,500 gallons Unleaded/3,000 gallons E85 CHS, Inc. (\$3.1354 Unleaded/\$2.4042 E85) Harms Oil (\$3.1155 Unleaded/\$2.5715 E85) Howes Oil and Olson Oil, both no bid. Bid aw

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: June 26, 2014 #2 Dyed Diesel Fuel 15,000 gallons Howes Oil (\$3.1150) Harms Oil (\$3.1315) CHS, Inc. (\$3.1324) Midwest Oil and Olson Oil, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Oil.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: June 27, 2014 Diesel (#1 and #2 blend) 620 gallons Howes Oil (\$2,166.27) Palisades Oil and Midway Service, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Oil.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: June 27, 2014 Unleaded 660 gallons Howes Oil (\$2,278.32) Palisades Oil and Midway Service, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Oil.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: June 30, 2014 #2 Dyed Diesel 1,000 gallons Howes Oil (\$3.259) Midwest Oil (\$3.309) and Stern Oil (\$3.490). Bid awarded to: Howes Oil.

A communication was received from Joleen Asmus requesting permission to consume, but not sell, wine, beer and liquor at the Old Courthouse Museum, 200 W. Sixth St., on Friday, September 12, 2014 from 6:30 p.m. until 10:30 p.m. for a wedding rehearsal

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 1, 2014 #2 Clear Diesel
7,500 gallons CHS, Inc. (\$3.2831) Harms Oil (\$3.4556) Howes Oil, Midwest Oil
and Petroleum Traders Cor., all no bid. Bid awarded to: CHS, Inc.

COUNCIL'S INTERNAL DEPARTMENTAL DIRECTIVES

APPLICATIONS

Gloria Garry, 617 S. Blauvelt Ave., for 2013 property taxes in the amount of
\$235.88.

NOTICE OF HEARINGS

REGULAR AGENDA ITEMS

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

PUBLIC INPUT

PETITIONS

UNFINISHED BUSINESS

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for the Movember Foundation to be
operated at Riverdale Park, 2000 East 24th Street, for a Mustache Dache Run on
July 12, 2014, and to authorize publication of the notice on 06-27-14 to set
the hearing date.

INTRODUCTION AND ADOPTION OF ORDINANCES

HEARINGS AND RESOLUTIONS

NOTICE OF HEARINGS FOR STREET VACATIONS

A PROPOSED RESOLUTION VACATING THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY ON S. MEREDITH AVE. WEST
OF W. 77TH ST., AS SHOWN ON EXHIBIT A.

REPORT OF OFFICERS/BOARDS/COMMITTEES/TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRIATION
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS WITHIN A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANIZATIONAL UNIT AS PROVIDED
IN THE SIOUX FALLS CITY CHARTER SECTION 5.07(d)

NEW BUSINESS

ITEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLINE

ADJOURNMENT

EXECUTIVE SESSION