

City Council Meetings
2/13/2013 7:00:00 PM

SIRE Meeting Contents

INVOCATION

City Council Member Rex Rolfing

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

PROCLAMATIONS

RECOGNITION/AWARDS

VISITOR RECOGNITION

CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

MINUTES

Informational Meeting of Tuesday, February 5, 2013, at 4:00 p.m.

Regular City Council Meeting of Tuesday, February 5, 2013, at 7:00 p.m.

COMMUNICATIONS

Approval of Contracts/Agreements on February 7, 2013 memo.

Notice of change orders on February 7, 2013 memo.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013 Unleaded Ethanol 8,500 Gallons Harms Oil (\$3.1270) Howes Oil (\$3.1345) CHS, Inc. (\$3.1680) Olson Oil, no bid. Bid awarded to: Harms Oil.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013 #2 Clear Diesel 7,500 Gallons CHS, Inc. (\$3.444) Harms Oil (\$3.423) Howes Oil and Midwest Oil, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Harms Oil.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013 Diesel (#1 and #2 blend) 600 Gallons Howes Oil (\$2,098.80) Midway Service (\$2,124.00) Palisades Oil, no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Oil.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013 Unleaded 650 Gallons Howes Oil (\$2,084.87) Midway Service (\$2,110.55) Palisades Oil, no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Oil.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: February 1, 2013 #1 & #2 Dyed Diesel Fuel 3,000 Gallons #1 & 4,500 Gallons #2 Howes Oil (#1 = \$3.3900/#2 = \$3.2235) Harms Oil (#1 = \$3.3945/#2 = \$3.2325) CHS, Inc. (#1 = \$3.6200/#2 = \$3.2400) Midwest Oil and Ol

A communication was received from the Siouxland Heritage Museums Alliance stating their intent to sell raffle tickets from March 1, 2013 until June 7, 2013 for a child's oak rocking chair (valued at \$250.00). Tickets will be sold for \$2.00 for one.

A communication was received from the History Club requesting permission to consume, but not sell, wine at the History Club, 758 S. Phillips Avenue on Tuesdays: March 5, April 2, May 7, June 4, July 2, August 6, September 3, October 1, November 5, an

COUNCIL'S INTERNAL DEPARTMENTAL DIRECTIVES

APPLICATIONS

David and Constance Langner, Parcel #46027, Tract 1 10 Sengson Addn to City of Sioux Falls, for 2012 property taxes in the amount of \$495.21. The previous board value was removed in error.

South Dakota Department of Transportation, for 2012 property taxes for Parcel #15126, (EX HY) 3 North Side Gardens Addn to City of Sioux Falls, in the amount of \$288.57 Parcel #15127, (EX HY) 4 North Side Gardens Addn to City of Sioux Falls, in the a

NOTICE OF HEARINGS

A PROPOSED RESOLUTION DECLARING THE NECESSITY TO CONSTRUCT SIDEWALK ON N. KIWANIS AVE., AND ASSESSING THE COST TO EACH LOT OR TRACT OF LAND BENEFITING THEREBY.

REGULAR AGENDA ITEMS

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

PUBLIC INPUT

PETITIONS

UNFINISHED BUSINESS

INTRODUCTION AND ADOPTION OF ORDINANCES

1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, AMENDING SECTION 32.022 OF CHAPTER 32, "CITY ORGANIZATIONS," TO REFLECT UPDATED TITLE OF INTERNAL AUDIT MANAGER.

HEARINGS AND RESOLUTIONS

NOTICE OF HEARINGS FOR STREET VACATIONS

REPORT OF OFFICERS/BOARDS/COMMITTEES/TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRIATION BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS WITHIN A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANIZATIONAL UNIT AS PROVIDED IN THE SIOUX FALLS CITY CHARTER SECTION 5.07(d)

NEW BUSINESS

ITEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLINE

ADJOURNMENT

EXECUTIVE SESSION