City of Sioux Falls Council Meeting
M nut es
Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street

REGULAR MEETI NG OF Tuesday, August 1, 2017, at 7 PM

ROLL CALL

MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT OFFI Cl AL AGENDA
PRESENT ABSENT
Counci| Menber Greg Neitzert

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Marshall Sel berg

Council Menber Pat Starr

Counci| Menber Theresa Stehly

Council Menber Christine M Erickson
Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach
Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

M chel | e Erpenbach, City Council or

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE
VI SI TOR RECOGNI TI ON

Sioux Falls LittleLeague All-Stars

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS
APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Rick Kiley to approve the Consent Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Mrshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.



Mot i on Passed.

M NUTES

Special City Council Meeting of Tuesday, July 18, 2017, at 2:30 p.m

I nformati onal Meeting of Tuesday, July 18, 2017, at 4 p.m

City Council Meeting of Tuesday, July 18, 2017, at 7 p.m

Joint City Council/M nnehaha County Conmi ssion Meeting of Tuesday,
July 25, 2017, at 5 p.m

COVMMUNI CATI ONS

1.

Approval of contracts/agreenents on the July 28, 2017, neno.

A conmuni cati on was received from Sarah Schreck requesting permission to
consune, but not sell, beer and wine at the History dub of Sioux Falls, 758
S. Phillips Avenue, on Saturday, Septenber 2, 2017, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-
5.5, for a wedding reception.

A conmuni cati on was received from Jessica Christians requesting permn ssion
to consune, but not sell, beer, wine, and liquor at the A d Courthouse
Museum 200 W Sixth St.,on Friday, October 13, 2017, from5 p.m to

m dni ght, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5 for an anniversary party.

A conmmuni cati on was received from Andy Schultz and M chael a Meiers
requesting permssion to consune, but not sell, wine and nalt beverages at
the History Cub of Sioux Falls, 758 S. Phillips Avenue, on Saturday,

Cct ober 14, 2017, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5, for a wedding reception.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 13, 2017; #2 Dyed Di esel;
7,500 Gallons; Mdway Service ($1.5765); Cole’ Petrol eum ($1.5738); Stern
Q1 ($1.575); Harnms O (%$1.5818); Howes Ql, CHS, Inc., and Oson OI, all
no bid. Bid awarded to: Cole's Petrol eum

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 17, 2017; #2 d ear
Diesel; 7,500 Gallons; CHS, Inc. ($1.93); Howe's OI, Harns G| and M dwest
Ol, all no bid. Bid awarded to: CHS, Inc.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 17, 2017; Unl eaded; 8, 500
Gl lons; Mdway Service ($1.7754); Cole's Petroleum ($1.7727); Stern Q|
($1.7883); Harnms O ($1.7790); Howes O l, CHS, Inc., and Oson OIl, all no
bid. Bid awarded to: Cole's Petrol eum

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 19, 2017; E-10 Unl eaded
Et hanol / 87 Cctane; 8,500 Gallons; Cole's Petroleum ($1. 7666); Harns Q|
($1.7778); Stern G ($1.7882); CHS, Inc. ($1.8100); Howes O | ($1.7845);

M dway Service ($1.7638); Oson Ol, no bid. Bid awarded to: Mdway Service.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 21, 2017; #2 Dyed D esel
Fuel ; 7,500 Gallons; Mdway Service ($1.6455); Cole's Petrol eum ($1. 6412);
Stern Gl ($1.6440); Howes O ($1.6435); CHS, Inc. ($1.6850); Harms G| and
O son G, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Cole's Petrol eum

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: July 21, 2017; #2 Dyed D esel



and Unl eaded Ethanol; 2,000 Gallons #2 Dyed Diesel and 6,000 Gall ons
Unl eaded Ethanol; M dway Service ($1.7633 Unl eaded and $1. 6260 #2 Dyed

10. Diesel; Cole s Petroleum ($1. 7646 Unl eaded and $1. 6197 #2 Dyed Diesel);
Harms O | ($1.7633 Unl eaded and $1.6203 #2 Dyed Diesel); Howes Ol ($1.7635
Unl eaded and $1. 6240 #2 Dyed Diesel);Stern Gl, CHS, Inc., and O son
Ol, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harnms Q.

APPLI CATI ONS
Speci al One-Day Liquor Licenses for The Meadow Barn to be operated at the
11. Multi-Cultural Center, 515 North Main Avenue, for weddi ngs on Septenber 23
and Cctober 14, 2017.
The foll owi ng abatenents were recommended for approval by the Director of
Equal i zation and the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for Mnnehaha County; and the
City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

12. Ross Wckman, 4821 S. Dunlap Avenue, for 2016 property tax in the anount of
$868. 87. Reason: conputer delay in generating the form

Al pha Center, 3405 S. Kiwanis, (parcel 59703) for 2016 property taxes in
13. the anount of $5,454.11. Reason: Tax exenpt property purchased on August
12, 2016.
Al pha Center, 3405 S. Kiwanis, (parcel 59704) for 2016 property taxes in
14. the anount of $168.75. Reason: Tax exenpt property purchased on August 12,
2016.
NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, August 15, 2017, at 7 p.m for Itens 15
t hrough 23:

15. New 2017 Retail Wne License for The Stag’'s Head LLC, The Stag' s Head, 6205
ad Village Place (CUP not required).
16. New 2017-18 Retail Malt Beverage License for The Stag’'s Head LLC, The Stag’'s
Head, 6205 A d Village Place (CUP not required).
Request to include video lottery terminals with the new 2017-18 Retail Malt
17. Beverage License for The Stag’s Head LLC, The Stag’s Head, 6205 A d Village

Pl ace.

18. New 2017 Retail Wne License for Envy Nail & Spa LLC, Envy Nail & Spa, 4212
West Enpire Place (CUP not required).

19. New 2017-18 Retail Malt Beverage License for Envy Nail & Spa LLC, Envy Nail
& Spa, 4212 West Enpire Place (CUP not required).

20. New 2017 O f-Sale Delivery License for TSlat Inc., JJ's Wne, Spirits &
Cigars, 4810 South Wstern Avenue.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Catering

21. Anerica, Chef Donminique's Catering to be operated at Poet, 4615 North Lew s
Avenue, for a social on August 22, 2017.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for



22. Stockyards Plaza Inc., to be operated at Stockyards Ag Experience Barn, 301
East Falls Park Drive, for donor appreciation events on August 23 & 24,
2017.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for The Banquet to be operated at

23. diff Avenue G eenhouse & Garden Center, 2101 East 26th Street, for a
fundrai ser on Cctober 5, 2017.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL COF REGULAR AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Marshall Selberg to approve the Regul ar Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Mrshal

Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach
Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

PUBLI C | NPUT

Bri an Maj erus spoke about the proposed rental registration ordi nance.

Lorrae Lindquist, nenber of the Sioux Falls Parks and Recreation Board, spoke
about the proposed Parks and Recreation Board ordi nance.

Sierra Broussard spoke about the diversity on the Parks and Recreation Board,
having a Community Resource O ficer in the Police Departnent, and reducing
crime in the city.

M ke GQunn spoke about the need for diversity on the Parks and Recreati on Board.

Ann Nachtigal, nenber of the Sioux Falls Parks and Recreation Board, spoke
about the proposed Parks and Recreation Board ordi nance.

Ti m St anga spoke about the proposed Parks and Recreation Board ordinance,
i mprovenents at Meldrum Park, and the proposed rental registration ordinance.

Davi d Zokaites spoke about drug prohibition

Scott Ehrisman spoke about the ticket sales for the Garth Brooks concerts and
access to water at JazzFest.

Jason Rei sdorfer, menber of the Sioux Falls Parks and Recreation Board,
spokeabout the proposed Parks and Recreation Board ordi nance.

Don Kearney, Director of Parks and Recreation, spoke about the proposed Parks
and Recreation Board ordi nance.

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS

New 2017-18 Package Malt Beverage/ South Dakota Farm Wnery License for 57th
24, Street Lodging Partners Corporation, Hanpton Inn & Suites, 3701 West Avera
Drive (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per Building Services.

25. New 2017-18 Package Malt Beverage/ Sout h Dakota Farm Wnery License for Mat
Lodge LLC, Meat Lodge, 3505 North diff Avenue (CUP not required).



New 2017-18 Retail Malt Beverage/ South Dakota Farm Wnery for The H deout
26. LLC, The Hideout, 1213 North diff Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final
i nspections per Fire and Health.

27. New 2017-18 Package Malt Beverage License for Conveni ence Plus Inc.,
Conveni ence Plus Inc., 1104 East 10th Street (CUP not required).

28. New 2017 O f-Sale Delivery License for Dom nique Fontenille, The Liquid
War ehouse, 230 South Phillips Avenue, Suite 100.

Transfer of 2017 Retail Wne License, with video lottery termnals, from
29. Tri State Gaming, Full House Casino, 5005 West 12th Street, to TJT Inc.,
Jokerz Casino 3, 5005 West 12th Street.

Transfer of 2017-18 Retail Malt Beverage License, with video lottery
30. termnals, fromTri State Gaming, Full House Casino, 5005 West 12th Street,
to TJT Inc., Jokerz Casino 3, 5005 West 12th Street.

31. Special One-Day Wne License for Butterfly House & Marine Cove, 4320 South
Oxbow Avenue, for a fundrai ser on August 8, 2017.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
32. M nnehaha & Lincoln County Denocrats to be operated at 758 South Phillips
Avenue, for a fundrai ser on August 17, 2017.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Sickies ND Inc, Sickies Garage to
33. be operated in Sickies Garage parking lot, 2616 South Loui se Avenue, for
the Bi ke Night finale on August 23, 2017.

Speci al One-Day Liquor License for Hy-Vee Inc., Al Qccasions by Hy-Vee to
34. be operated at The Point is to Serve Church, 506 North Kiwanis Avenue, for
a weddi ng reception on Septenber 16, 2017.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Council Menber Rick Kiley to approve Itens 24 through 34.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci|l Menber Greg Neitzert to anend Item 32 by changi ng August 17, 2017, to
August 18, 2017.

Vote to anend: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

Vote to approve, as anended: Roll Call: Yeses, Geg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing,
Marshal | Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle
Er penbach, Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.
| NTRODUCTI ON AND ADOPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG

PROPERTY LOCATED AT NORTHEAST CORNER OF E. 6TH ST. AND N. BAHNSON AVE. FROM
35. THE AG AGRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO THE LW LI VE- WORK DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO.

6219- 2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS.

Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (5-1).



Counci| Menber Theresa Stehly excused herself fromthe discussion and the vote
on Item 35.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menmber M chel |l e Erpenbach to adopt said O di nance.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menmber Christine M Erickson to anend Item 35 by inserting after the words "LW
Live-Wrk District", the following condition: "except MD-2 formuses are

prohi bi ted".

Vote to anend: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick Kiley, 6. Noes, Pat
Starr, 1.

Mot i on Passed.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr to refer this itemto the
Pl anni ng Conmi ssion. The notion died for |ack of a second.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menber Christine M Erickson to anmend this itemto add after the words "except
MD-2 formuses are prohibited", insert a seni-colon, and then add the follow ng
condition: "Traffic Inpact: Prior to issuance of a building pernmt, a traffic
and pedestrian plan will be required for approval by the City Engineering
Department. The City will also work with the devel oper of this property to
obtain the necessary public right-of-way for a future inprovenent of the 6th
Street and Bahnson Avenue |ntersection".

Vote to anend: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick Kiley, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menber Christine M Erickson to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, August 8, 2017, at 7 p.m for Item 35, as anended.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick Kil ey,
7. Noes, 0.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 4000 S. ELLIS RD. FROM THE AG AGRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO TH

36. RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO 6687-2017,

AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Marshal | Sel berg to adopt said O dinance No. 64-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick Kiley, 7.
Noes, Pat Starr, 1.



Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF Sl QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED SOUTH OF E. MADI SON ST. AND EAST OF N. SIX MLE RD. FROM THE AG

37. AGRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRI CT,
PETI TI ON NO. 6728-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG VAP OF THE CI TY OF
SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recommends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Marshall Selberg to adopt said O dinance No. 65-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 1320 S. M NNESOTA AVE. FROM THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY

38. RESI DENTI AL- TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT TO THE G2 COMVERCI AL- NEI GHBORHOCD AND
STREETCAR DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 6747-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Pat Starr to adopt said Odinance No. 66-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG

PROPERTY LOCATED AT 1806 E. MULBERRY ST. FROM THE RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX
39. RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRICT TO THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY

RESI DENTI AL- TRADI TI ONAL DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 6832-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE

OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssion

recommends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber M chelle Erpenbach to adopt said O dinance No. 67-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY

LOCATED AT 4900 S. COTTONWOOD PL. FROM THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL- LOW
40. DENSITY DI STRICT TO THE O OFFI CE DI STRICT, PETITION NO 6891-2017, AND

AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anning

Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Council Menber Rick Kiley to withdraw Item 40.

Vote to withdraw. Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,



Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.
Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 3201 S. THEODORE AVE. FROM THE O OFFI CE DI STRICT TO THE
41. RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL- LOW DENSI TY DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO. 6906-2017, AND

AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anning
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Rick Kiley to adopt said Odinance No. 69-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED NORTH OF W 57TH ST. AND WEST OF |-229 FROM THE LW LI VE- WOR

42. DI STRICT TO THE O OFFI CE AND C 2 COMVERCI AL- NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR
DI STRICTS, PETITION NO 6912-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF
THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conm ssi on recommends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Rick Kiley to adopt said Odinance No. 70-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 5509 N. QUARRY AVE. FROM THE G 2 COMMERCI AL- NEI GHBORHOCD

43. AND STREETCAR DI STRICT TO THE I-1 LI GHT | NDUSTRI AL DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO.
6937-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS.
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to adopt said Odinance No. 71-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 3810 N. CAREER AVE. FROM THE O OFFI CE AND RA-2 APARTMENT

44, RESI DENTI AL- MODERATE DENSI TY DI STRI CTS TO THE LW LI VE-WORK DI STRI CT, PETITIO
NO. 6938-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI CI AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FAL

LS.
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (6-0).



A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menber Christine M Erickson to adopt said Ordi nance No. 72-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED AT 2601 E. 8TH ST. FROM THE RA-2 APARTMENT

45. RESI DENTI AL- MODERATE DENSI TY DI STRICT TO THE LW LI VE-WORK DI STRI CT, PETI Tl ON

NO. 6963-2017, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY COF SI QUX
FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmm ssi on recomends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance No. 73-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

46. 2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG
GRATUI TOUS TRANSFER OF REAL PROPERTY.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance No. 63-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

47. 2ndReadi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG AN
COFFER TO PURCHASE REAL PROPERTY FROM THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Greg Neitzert to adopt said Ordi nance No. 68-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall Selberg,
Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick
Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, August 8, 2017, at 7 p.m
for Item 48:

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE

48. OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 95: PARKS AND RECREATI ON,
REQUI R NG PARK BOARD COWMPCSI TI ON BASED ON CI TY COUNCI L DI STRI CTS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Theresa Stehly and seconded by Counci l
Menber Greg Neitzert to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
August 8, 2017, at 7 p.m for Item 48.



Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Sel berg, Pat
Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Rick Kil ey,
7. Noes, Rex Rolfing, 1.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, August 8, 2017, at 7 p.m
for Item 49:

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
49. OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 150: BUI LDI NG RENTAL
HOUSI NG

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Theresa Stehly to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, August 8, 2017, at 7 p.m for |tem 49.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, August 15, 2017, at 7 p.m
for Item 50:

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
50. OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 111: ALCOHCLI C BEVERAGES TO
PROVI DE FOR AN OFF- SALE DELI VERY CLASSI FI CATI ON AND FEE.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Marshall Selberg to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, August
15, 2017, at 7 p.m for |Item50.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, August 22, 2017, at 5 p.m
at the Joint Cty Council/M nnehaha County Meeting for |tem 51:

1st Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE AMENDI NG THE 2002 REVI SED JO NT ZONI NG ORDI NANCE
51. FOR M NNEHAHA COUNTY AND THE CI TY OF Sl QUX FALLS BY REZONI NG CERTAI N
PROPERTY.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber

M chel | e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, August
22, 2017, at 5 p.m at the Joint City Council/M nnehaha County Meeting for Item
51.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mot i on Passed.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS



52. A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF Sl QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
WLLOWVRIDGE 1l ADDI TION. Pl anni ng Conmmi ssi on reconmends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to adopt said Resolution No. 66-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle
Er penbach, Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 66-17

A RESCLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
[WLLOWRIDGE Il ADDI TI QN .

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD:

That the prelinmnary plan of [Wllow Ridge Il Addition] to the City of Sioux
Fall's, [ M nnehaha ] County, SD, is hereby approved, and the City
Cerk of the City of Sioux Falls is hereby directed to endorse on such plan a
copy of this resolution and certify the sane thereon.

Dat e adopted: 08/01/17 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Thomas M Greco

Cty derk

53. A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF Sl QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
SPRI NGDALE ADDI TI ON. Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on recommends approval (6-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to adopt said Resolution No. 67-17.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Greg Neitzert, Rex Rolfing, Marshall
Sel berg, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle
Er penbach, Rick Kiley, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 67-17

A RESCLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
[ SPRI NGDALE ADDI TI ON ].

BE I T RESOCLVED BY THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD:

That the prelinmnary plan of [Springdale Addition ] to the City of Sioux Falls,
[ M nnehaha ] County, SD, is hereby approved, and the Gty derk of
the City of Sioux Falls is hereby directed to endorse on such plan a copy of
this resolution and certify the sane thereon.



Dat e adopted: 08/01/17 .
M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Thomas M Greco

Cty derk

REPORT OF OFFI CERS/ BOARDS/ COVM TTEES/ TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRI ATI ON
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS W THI N A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI T AS PROVI DED
IN THE SI OQUX FALLS C TY CHARTER SECTI ON 5. 07(d)

54, REPORT OF THE JULY 13, 2017, NOTI CE OF TRANSFER OF APPROPRI ATI ONS
W TH N MAJOR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI TS.

ADJ OQURNMENT

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council
Menber Rick Kiley to adjourn the neeting at 9:36 p.m

Mayor M ke T. Huether called for a voice vote. Al nenbers voted yes.
Mot i on Passed.

Tamara Jorgensen, MVC

Assistant City Oerk

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE: UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE
PROVI DED FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TI ES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERK' S

OFFI CE, CARNEG E TOWN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD)
24 HOURS | N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE CI TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCI L WLL ACT AS A DEC SI ON- MAKER ON AN

UPCOM NG MATTER I NVOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO
PROVI DE WRI TTEN COMMENTS TO THE ENTIRE CI TY COUNCIL OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COMMENT
AT THE PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM IS CONSI DERED BY THE ENTIRE CI TY

COUNCI L. THOSE WHO PROVI DE COMVENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT

THEI R COMMENTS MAY BECOMVE PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EW BY
ALL PARTIES AND THE PUBLI C

ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE
M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE
LIMTED TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETINGS ON CI TYLI NK: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGS

AR LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COW TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE
THE FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MMEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE
I NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NG CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS AR LIVE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M THE JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5
P.M REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCHI VED AND AVAI LABLE

FOR VI EW NG ON DEMAND AT WAN SI QUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NG S

VI DEO ARE POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.



CLOSED CAPTIONING CITY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLCSE CAPTI ONED ON CI TYLI NK.

CI TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGS, COWM TTEE MEETI NGS, AND

CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON FRI DAYS AND SATURDAYS. JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS ON FI RST FRI DAY AND SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETING GO TO
"ClI TYLI NK" AT WAW SI QUXFALLS. ORG FOR SPECI FI C PROGRAMM NG TI MES.



