| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| M nut es |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
|| REGULAR MEETI NG OF Monday, Novenber 5, 2018, at 7 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT

PRESENT ABSENT
Counci| Menber Janet Brekke

Counci| Menber Christine M Erickson

Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Counci| Menber Greg Neitzert

Counci| Menber Marshall Sel berg

Counci| Menber Curt Soehl

Counci| Menber Pat Starr

Counci| Menber Theresa Stehly

Mayor Paul TenHaken

I NVOCATI ON

e Tom Rooney, Direct Line Prayer Partner
PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

RECOGNI TI ON AWARDS

e SIOUXPERHERO Citizen Recognition Awards
e 2018 Citizen Planning Acadeny Graduates
CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Marshal | Sel berg to approve the Consent Agenda.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to anend by w thdrawi ng Sub-Itens 38-42 fromltem 1.
Vote to withdraw. Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Vote to approve, as anended: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M
Erickson, Rick Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr,
Theresa Stehly, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.



M NUTES

e Informational Meeting of Monday, COctober 15, 2018, at 4 p.m

e« City Council Meeting of Mnday, Cctober 15, 2018, at 7 p.m

e Informational Meeting of Tuesday, COctober 23, 2018, at 2 p.m

e Joint Gty Council/M nnehaha County Conmi ssion Meeting of Tuesday, Cctober
23, 2018, at 5 p.m

COVMMUNI CATI ONS

1. Approval of contracts/agreenents on the Novenber 2, 2018, neno.
Sub-itens 38-42 were wi thdrawn during the approval of the Consent Agenda.

2. Approval of notice of change orders on the Novenber 2, 2018, neno.

3. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: COctober 11, 2018; 7,500
Gal l ons of #2 Dyed Diesel; Mdway Service ($2.5180); Coles Petrol eum
($2.5016); Harnms O ($2.5225); Howes O ($2.5090); Stern G, CHS, Inc.
and Oson G1l, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Coles Petrol eum

4. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: COctober 12, 2018; 700 Gall ons
of Unl eaded Ethanol; M dway Service ($2.2892); Howes Ol (%$2.2860); Stern
Ol, Coles Petroleum Harms G, CHS, Inc., and Ason OIl, all no bid. Bid
awarded to: Howes QO I.

5. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: October 15, 2018; Unl eaded
Et hanol (8,500 Gallons) & #2 Dyed Diesel (7,500 Gallons); Mdway Service
($2. 2058 Unl eaded & $2.6755 Diesel); Coles Petroleum ($2.1970 Unl eaded &
$2.6808 Diesel); Harns Ol ($2.3998 Unl eaded & $2. 6631 Diesel); Howes QG I,
Stern Gl, CHS, Inc., and Ason Gl, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Cole’'s
Pet rol eum

6. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: COctober 18, 2018; #1 Dyed
Di esel (400 Gallons) & #2 Dyed Diesel (400 Gallons); Howes QO ($2.7825 #1
Dyed Diesel & $2.5325 #2 Dyed Diesel); Stern G| ($2.8867 #1 Dyed Diesel &
$2.61 #2 Dyed Diesel); Mdway Service, Coles Petroleum Harns G|, CHS,
Inc., and Oson G, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes QO |.

7. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: COctober 22, 2018; 50/50 Bl end
Dyed Diesel (750 Gallons); Mdway Service ($2.67); Stern G| (%$2.71); CHS,
Inc, Ason Ol, Coles Petroleum Harnms G|, and Howes G|, all no bid. Bid
awarded to: M dway Servi ce.



8.

10.

11.

12.

13.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: Cctober 23, 2018; 8,500

@Gl | ons of Unl eaded Ethanol; Coles Petrol eum ($2.2157); Stern GO |
($2.2902); Mdway Service, Harnms O |, Howes O, CHS, Inc., and Oson O,
all no bid. Bid awarded to: Coles Petrol eum

Sioux Area Metro. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: Cctober 23,
2018; 7,500 Gallons of #2 Clear Diesel; Howes Ql, Inc. ($2.784); Harns Q I,
CHS Inc., Petroleum Traders, and Mdwest G I, all no bid. Bid awarded to:
Howes O |, Inc.

A conmmuni cati on was received from Messi ah New Hope Lut heran Church
requesting permssion to consune, but not sell, wine and nalt beverages at
Messi ah New Hope Lut heran Church, 5001 E. Madi son St., on Sunday, Novenber
18, 2018, from2 p.m to 6 p.m, pursuant to SDCL 35-1-5.5 for a "Down-Hone
for the Holidays" concert.

A conmuni cati on was received fromthe Siouxland Heritage Miseum requesti ng
permi ssion to consune, but not sell, beer and wine at the A d Courthouse
Museum 200 W 6th St., on Thursday, Novenber 29, 2018, pursuant to SDCL
35-1-5.5 for an exhi bit opening reception.

A conmuni cati on was received requesting perm ssion to consune, but not
sell, wine and malt beverages at the Butterfly House & Aquarium 4320 S.
Oxbow Ave. on Thursday, Decenber 6, 2018, from5 p.m - 6:30 p.m, pursuant
to SDCL 35-1-5.5 for a Donor Appreciation Night.

Statenent of daimfor Mechanic's and/or Materialman’s Lien relating to a
Public I nprovenent Project froml1-29 Brick Conpany for work and naterials
furnished for the City of Sioux Falls Adm nistration Building. Henry

Carl son Construction, LLC, is the general contractor.

APPLI CATI ONS

14.

15.

Speci al One-Day Liquor Licenses for Washi ngton Pavilion Managenent Inc.,
Washi ngton Pavilion of Arts & Sciences, 301 South Main Avenue, for special
events on Decenber 15, 2018, May 25 and June 22, 2019.

Various Retail Liquor, Package Liquor, and Retail Wne License renewals for
2019 to be operated at locations in the Gty of Sioux Falls, SD, identified
as Exhibit A

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, Novenber 20, 2018, for Itens 16 through 19:

16.

New 2018-19 Retail Malt Beverage License for Regal Hol dings Inc., Paradise
Central Casino Il, 1821 West 12th Street, Suite D, with Conditional Use
Pernmit being approved on July 5, 2018.



17. Request to include video lottery terminals with the new 2018-19 Retail Malt
Beverage License for Regal Holdings Inc., Paradise Central Casino Il, 1821
West 12th Street, Suite D

18. Transfer of 2018 Retail Liquor License, including video lottery term nals,
from 50/50 Hol dings Inc., Deuces Casino 9, 2601 South Carolyn Avenue, to
Commonweal th Gam ng & Hol di ngs Co, Deuces Casino 6, 510 South Valley View
Road, Suite 1 (CUP not required).

19. Special One-Day Liquor License for T Slat Inc., JJs Wne, Spirits and
Cigars, to be operated at Sanford Foundati on House, 2335 East 60th Street
North, for a Christmas Party on Decenber 6, 2018.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci|l Menber Rick Kiley to approve the Regul ar Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

PUBLI C | NPUT

John Nordlie spoke about planning, zoning, sale, and devel opnent at the
property around 6th and Bahnson Avenue.

John Cunni ngham spoke about using citizen tax dollars to provide police
protection at a private, political fundraiser held in the Cty of Sioux Falls
i n August.

Chri st opher Bruce spoke about his concerns of people using the 5G network.

Scott Ehri sman spoke about President Trunps recent private event in Sioux
Fal Il s; and about bringing food and drink into the Levitt Pavilion

Rhanda Hel | er spoke about zoning, water, and drai nage issues in the duplex she
purchased with her daughter.

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS

20. New 2019 Retail Wne License for Teng Ranen Inc., Ranen Fuji, 2300 South
M nnesota Avenue, Suite C, with Conditional Use Permt (9222-2018) being
approved on Cctober 3, 2018. Pending final inspections per Health.



21. New 2018-19 Retail Malt Beverage License for Teng Ranen Inc., Ranen Fuji,
2300 South M nnesota Avenue, Suite C, with Conditional Use Pernmit (9222-
2018) being approved on Cctober 3, 2018. Pending final inspections per
Heal t h.

22. New 2018-19 Retail Malt Beverage License, requesting off-sale use only, for
| -90 Fuel Services Inc., Gas Stop, 5210 West 12th Street (CUP not
required). Pending final inspections per Health.

23. Special One-Day Liquor License for T Slat, JJs Fine Wne, Spirits & Cigars
to be operated at Sanford | nagenetics, 1321 West 22nd Street, for a
physi ci an ni xer on Novenber 8, 2018.

24. Special One-day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering America, Chef Doniniques Catering to be operated at Othopedic
Institute, 810 East 23rd Street, for a holiday party on Novenber 29, 2018.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Greg Neitzert to approve Itens 20 through 24.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick

Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

25. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 6300 W 41ST ST. FROM THE S-1 GENERAL | NSTI TUTI ONAL DI STRICT TO
THE RA 2 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL MODERATE DENSI TY DI STRI CT PETI TI ON NO. 8738-
2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS.

Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (7-1) with the foll ow ng
conditions: 1) Required side yard setback along the north property line, a
m ni mum of 60 feet; and, 2) Buffer yard along the north property |line shall
include a 27 bermand 6 privacy fence.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menber Christine M Erickson to adopt said Ordi nance No. 97-18.

A notion was made by Council Menber Theresa Stehly and seconded by Counci l
Menber Pat Starr to defer this itemto the Cty Council Meeting on Tuesday,
Novenber 20, 2018, at 7 p.m

Vote to defer: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly, 3.
Noes, Christine M Erickson, Rick Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Sel berg, Curt
Soehl, 5.

Motion Fail ed.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, 7. Noes, Theresa
Stehly, 1.

Mbti on Passed.



26. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 608 W 57TH ST. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN
DI STRICT TO THE RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT NO.
9129-2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS.
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (7-1).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to adopt said O dinance No. 98-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, 7. Noes,
Theresa Stehly, 1.

Mbti on Passed.

27. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 1201 S. 7TH AVE. FROM THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT TO THE RT-2 TOAHQOVE
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT NO. 9171-2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to adopt said O dinance No. 99-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

28. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 700 S. 1ST AVE. FROM THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT TO THE RT-2 TOAHQOVE
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT NO. 9173 2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Marshall Selberg to adopt said O di nance No. 100-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

29. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 1001 E. 52ND ST. N. FROM THE I-1 LI GHT I NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT TO
THE 1-2 HEAVY | NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT NO. 9178-2018, AND AVENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Curt Soehl to adopt said Odinance No. 101-18.



Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

30. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 801 N. DULUTH AVE. FROM THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT TO THE RT-2 TOAHQOVE
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRI CT NO. 9182-2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI CI AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Neitzert and seconded by Council
Menmber Curt Soehl to adopt said O di nance No. 102-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, 7. Noes, O.
Theresa Stehly was absent for the vote on this item

Mbti on Passed.

31. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 500 E. 69TH ST. FROM THE O OFFI CE DI STRICT TO THE C
2 COWMMERCI AL NEI GHBORHOCOD AND STREETCAR DI STRI CT NO. 9296-2018, AND
AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anning
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Curt Soehl to adopt said Odinance No. 103-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, 7. Noes, O.
Theresa Stehly was absent for the vote on this item

Mbti on Passed.

32. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 616 S. WLLOWAVE. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT TO THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRI CT NO. 9319-2018, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval (8-0).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Council Menber Rick Kiley to adopt said Odinance No. 104-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 33:

33. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS. Hi ghways & Streets ($980, 000).

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Curt Soehl to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Novenber 13,



2018, at 7 p.m for Item 33.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,

8. Noes, 0.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 34:

34. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SIQUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
PROVI SI ONAL SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS FOR SNOW REMOVAL OPERATI ONS.
Hi ghways and Streets ($1, 000, 000).

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Janet Brekke to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m for Item 34.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,

8. Noes, 0.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 35;:

35. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 117: PEDDLERS AND VENDERS,
SUBCHAPTER: Ri ght-of -Way All owances in the Central Business District;
Generally TO ALLON NAURAL GAS FIRE PITS I N FURNI TURE ZONES.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Council Menber Rick Kiley to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m for Item 35.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,

8. Noes, 0.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 36:

36. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOQUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE
NAM NG OF A FACILITY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. "Papa John’s Party Room 1"
and "Papa John’s Party Room 2" at the M dco Aquatic Center.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m for |Item 36.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,

8. Noes, 0.

Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m
for Item 37:

37. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE
NAM NG OF A FACILITY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. "Sanford Health 50 Meter



Pool " and "Sanford Health Mezzani ne" at M dco Aquatic Center.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Council Menber Rick Kiley to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Novenber 13, 2018, at 7 p.m for Item 37.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbt i on Passed.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

38. A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE RELEASE OF PERVANENT EASEMENTS LOCATED I N THE
NWL/ 4 OF SECTI ON 6- T101N- RAOW OF THE 5TH P.M AND IN LOT 1, BLOCK 5 OF
SANFORD SPORTS COVPLEX SOQUTH ADDI TION TO THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, ALL IN
M NNEHAHA COUNTY, SD.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Curt Soehl to adopt said Resolution No. 98-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 98-18

A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE RELEASE OF PERMANENT EASEMENTS LOCATED I N THE NWL/

4 OF SECTION 6- TI01IN-RAOW OF THE 5TH P.M AND IN LOT 1, BLOCK 5 OF SANFORD
SPORTS COVPLEX SOUTH ADDI TION TO THE CI TY OF SIOQUX FALLS, ALL IN M NNEHAHA
COUNTY, SD.

VWHEREAS, the City of Sioux Falls, SD, no |onger needs the pernanent easenents
for drainage and utility purposes across the above-described real property, as
shown on Exhibit A Signed approvals fromall public and private utilities are
on file with the office of the Cty Engineer;

WHEREAS, the pernmanent easenents were established by easenent docunent recorded
in Book 238 of M scell aneous on page 990 in the office of the Register of Deeds
for M nnehaha County, SD, on January 10, 2001, and by plats filed in Book 62 of
Pl ats on pages 249 and 250 in the office of the Register of Deeds for M nnehaha
County, SD, on Decenber 26, 2000, and were reaffirnmed by plat and filed in Book
80 of Plats on page 238 in the Register of Deeds for M nnehaha County, SD, on
Sept enber 18, 2018;

NOW THEREFORE, BE I T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That it approves the rel ease of the permanent easenents for drai nage and
utility purposes, as shown on attached Exhibit A and affecting the real
property described as the NW/4 of Section 6-T101N-R49Wof the 5th P.M and Lot
1, Block 5 of Sanford Sports Conplex South Addition to the Gty of Sioux Falls,
all in Mnnehaha County, SD, and that the Cty Cerk shall cause to be recorded
with the Register of Deeds, M nnehaha County, SD, a duly certified transcript
of this resolution.

Dat e adopted: 11/05/18 .

Paul TenHaken



Mayor

ATTEST:

Thomas M G eco
Cty derk

39. A RESOLUTI ON TO APPROVE A HI STCORI C MARKER ON CI TY PROPERTY.

A notion was made by Council Menber Janet Brekke and seconded by Council Menber
Marshal | Sel berg to adopt said Resolution No. 99-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Geg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 99-18

A RESOLUTI ON TO APPROVE A HI STORI C MARKER ON CI TY PROPERTY.

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That it approves the placenent of the following historic marker on Cty
property by the M nnehaha County Historical Society:

Hi storic Marker

Locati on

The First Jew sh House of Worship in South Dakota Van Eps Park

Dat e adopted: 11/05/18 .

Paul TenHaken

Mayor

ATTEST:

Thomas M G eco
Cty derk

40. A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE COLLECTI VE BARGAI NI NG AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CI TY
OF SI QUX FALLS AND THE SI QUX FALLS FI REFI GHTERS ASSOCI ATI ON.

A notion was made by Council Menber Pat Starr and seconded by Council Menber
Curt Soehl to adopt said Resolution No. 100-18.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Janet Brekke, Christine M Erickson, Rick
Kiley, Greg Neitzert, Marshall Selberg, Curt Soehl, Pat Starr, Theresa Stehly,
8. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 100-18

A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE COLLECTI VE BARGAI NI NG AGCREEMENT BETWEEN THE CI TY OF
Sl QUX FALLS AND THE SI OUX FALLS FI REFI GHTERS ASSOCI ATI ON.

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

1. That the Coll ective Bargai ni ng Agreenent between the City of Sioux
Falls and the Sioux Falls Firefighters Association providing for terns and
conditions of enploynent for the period fromJanuary 1, 2019, through Decenber
31, 2020, is hereby approved by the Cty Council.



Dat e adopted: 11/05/18 .

Paul TenHaken

Mayor

ATTEST:

Thomas M G eco
Cty derk

REPORT OF OFFI CERS/ BOARDS/ COVM TTEES/ TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRI ATI ON
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS W THI N A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI T AS PROVI DED
IN THE SI OQUX FALLS C TY CHARTER SECTI ON 5. 07(d)

41. REPORT OF THE OCTOBER 31, 2018, NOTICE OF TRANSFER OF APPROPRI ATI ONS W THI N
MAJOR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI TS.

ADJ OQURNMENT

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to adjourn the neeting at 10:04 p. m
Mayor Paul TenHaken called for a voice vote. Al nenbers voted yes.
Mbti on Passed.
Tamara Jorgensen, MVC
Assistant City Oerk

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOAWN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCIL WLL ACT AS A DECI S| ON- MAKER ON AN UPCOM NG
MATTER | N\VOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE

WR TTEN COMMENTS TO THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COWMENT AT THE
PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM | S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE
WHO PROVI DE COMMENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMVENTS MAY
BECOME PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EWBY ALL PARTI ES AND THE
PUBLI C.

ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L:  PUBLIC I NPUT |'S ALLOAED FOR ANY | TEM ON THE REGULAR
AGENDA. NOTW THSTANDI NG THE PRECEDI NG SENTENCE, THE PUBLI C | NPUT PORTI ON AT THE
START OF A CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NG SHALL LAST NO MORE THAN 30 M NUTES AND W LL BE
LI M TED TO TOPI CS WHI CH DO NOT | N\VOLVE THOSE REGULAR AGENDA | TEMS APPEARI NG
LATER | N THE AGENDA AS PUBLI C | NPUT WLL BE RECElI VED WHEN THAT | TEM IS UP FOR
DI SCUSSI ON.  PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE M CROPHONE AT THE

PODI UM  PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME AND UNLESS FURTHER TI ME |'S GRANTED BY THE
COUNCI L, SHALL BE LIM TED TO THREE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON Cl TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COWM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE
FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

| NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NG, CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS Al R LI VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
TH RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M THE JO NT Cl TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY
COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5 P. M

REGULAR MEETI NGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCH VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR

VI EW NG ON DEMAND ATWAW S| OUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON Cl TYLI NK.



CI TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGS, COWM TTEE MEETI NGS, AND G TY
COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON FRI DAYS AND SATURDAYS. JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY
COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS ON FI RST FRI DAY AND SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETING GO TO

CI TYLI NK AT WAV SI QUXFALLS. ORG FOR SPECI FI C PROGRAMM NG TI MES.



