| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| M nut es |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
|| REGULAR MEETI NG OF Tuesday, Decenber 1, 2015, at 7 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT OFFI Cl AL AGENDA

PRESENT ABSENT
Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr.

Counci | Menber Christine M Erickson

Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach

Counci| Menber Greg Janison

Counci| Menber Dean Karsky

Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers

Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

e Susie Wngler, Prayer Mnister - Direct Line Prayer Center

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council

Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. to approve the Consent Agenda.

A request was nade by Council Menber Christine M Erickson to nove the
following three Finance itens fromltem 1l to the Regular Agenda for discussion
purposes: 1) Bond Counsel Services; 2) and 3) both are Financial Advisory
Servi ces.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jani son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

M NUTES
e Informational Meeting of Tuesday, Novenber 17, 2015, at 4 p.m

e City Council Meeting of Tuesday, Novenber 17, 2015, at 7 p.m



COVMMUNI CATI ONS

1. Approval of contracts/agreenents on the Novenber 27, 2015, neno.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to approve the followi ng Finance item Bond Counsel
Services, Agreenent for Services (debt issuance), PerkinsCole LLP, $52,500.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Geg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, Kermit L. Staggers, 1.

Mbti on Passed.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to approve the following two Finance itens: Financial

Advi sory Services, Agreenent for Services (debt issuance), Public Financial
Managenent, $25,000; and Financi al Advisory Services, $.45 per $1,000 bonds,
Publ i ¢ Fi nanci al Managenent.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Greg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, Kermit L. Staggers, 1.

Mbti on Passed.

2. Approval of the notice of change orders on the Novenber 27, 2015, neno.

3. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated Novenber 10, 2015; Unl eaded
Et hanol, 429 Gallons; Mdway Service ($1.9550); Howes O (%$2.0450); Stern
G1l, no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Service.

4. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated Novenber 10, 2015; Cear Diesel
#1; 331 Gallons; Mdway Service ($2.2705); Howes O (%$2.2985); Stern O,
no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Service.

5. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: Novenber 10, 2015; d ear
Di esel #2; 331 Gallons; Mdway Service ($1.9555); Howes O ($1.9755); Stern
G1l, no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Service.

6. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated Novenber 11, 2015; #2 Cear
Diesel; 7,500 Gallons; CHS, Inc. ($1.9459); Harns Q| ($2.002); Howes QO I,
M dwest G| and Petrol eum Traders Co., all no bid. Bid awarded to: CHS, Inc.

7. Report of Requests for Quotes of Fuel dated Novenber 18, 2015; Unl eaded
Et hanol & #1 Dyed Diesel; 5,000 Gallons Unleaded/ 3,000 Gallons #1; Harns Q|
($1. 7635 Unl eaded/ $1. 6967 #1 Diesel); CHS, Inc., Cole's Petroleum Howes Q|
and O son G, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harns QO |.



8.

10.

11.

Request for Quotes for Fuel dated Novenber 20, 2015; #1 and #2 Dyed Di esel
Fuel ; 7,500 Gallons each (Total 15,000 Gallons); Harns G| ($1.9240 #1

Di esel Fuel and $1.6223 #2 Diesel Fuel); Cole s Petroleum CHS, Inc., Howes
Ol, Mdwest GI, and Ason Ql, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harnms Q.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated Novenber 23, 2015; Unl eaded

Et hanol ; #1 Dyed Diesel; and #2 Dyed Diesel; 2,000 Gallons Unl eaded/ 3, 000
Gl lons #1 Diesel; and 3,000 Gallons #2 Diesel; Howes Q| ($1.5360 Unl eaded/
$1. 8660 #1 Diesel/ and $1.5315 #2 Diesel); Harms O ($1.5622 Unl eaded/
$1.8973 #1 Diesel/and $1.5657 #2 Diesel); Cole's Petroleum CHS, Inc. and
Oson G, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes QO |.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated Novenber 24, 2015; Unl eaded
Et hanol ; #1 Dyed Diesel; and #2 Dyed Diesel; 2,000 Gallons Unl eaded/ 3, 000
Gl lons #1 Diesel; and 3,000 Gallons #2 Diesel; Harns Q| ($1.6094

Unl eaded/ $1.8081 #1 Diesel,/ and $1.5081 #2 Diesel); Cole's Petrol eum
($1. 8150 Unl eaded/ $1.8175 #1 Diesel/and $1.4815 #2 Diesel); CHS, Inc.,
Howes O | and A son GI, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harns O |.

Report of Requests for Quotes of Fuel dated Novenber 24, 2015; #2 Cear

Di esel; 7,500 Gallons; Howes Q1| ($1.7315); Harns Q| ($1.7726); CHS, Inc.,
M dwest G|, and Petrol eum Traders Co., all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes
al.

APPLI CATI ONS

12.

Various Retail Liquor, Package Liquor, and Retail Wne License renewal s
for 2016 to be operated at various locations in the City of Sioux Falls,
SD, identified as Exhibit C

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS
Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for Itens 13
t hrough 23:

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

Transfer of 2016 Retail Liquor License, with Sunday sales certificate and
video lottery termnals, from Red Buffalo Tradi ng Conpany Inc., Skellys
Pub & Grill, 130 South Phillips Avenue, to Pave, LLC, Skellys Pub & Gill,
130 South Phillips Avenue.

New 2016 Retail Wne License for Guillerno Pedro, M Tierra Authentic
Mexi can Restaurant & Bakery, 337 South Phillips Avenue.

New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for Guillerno Pedro, M Tierra
Aut henti c Mexi can Restaurant & Bakery, 337 South Phillips Avenue.

New 2016 Retail Wne License for Golden Coin Casino, Inc., Golden Coin
Casi no, 2505 West Russell Street, Suite 101.

Transfer of 2015 Retail Liquor License, with video lottery termnals, from
SKK LLC, The Copper Lounge, 136 South Phillips Avenue, to IJK LLC, The
Copper Lounge, 136 South Phillips Avenue.



18. Renewal of 2016 Retail Liquor License for |JK LLC, The Copper Lounge, 136
South Phillips Avenue.

19. Transfer of 2015 Retail Liquor License, with Sunday sales certificate, from
TSK Inc., Stogeez Cigar Lounge, 215 South Phillips Avenue, to |JK Inc.,
St ogeez Cigar Lounge, 215 South Phillips Avenue.

20. Renewal of 2016 Retail Liquor License for 1JK Inc., Stogeez Ci gar Lounge,
215 South Phillips Avenue.

21. Transfer of 2015-16 Package Malt Beverage/ South Dakota Farm Wne |icense
from Freedom Valu Centers Inc., Erickson Valu Center, 1601 South M nnesota
Avenue, to Jay AMBE-2, LLC, Freedom Valu Center, 1601 South M nnesota
Avenue.

22. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering Anerica Inc., to be operated at The Carpenter Ballroom 221 South
Phillips Avenue, for holiday parties on January 8 and 9, 2016

23. Various Retail Liquor, Package Liquor, and Retail Wne License renewals for
2016 to be operated at various locations in the Cty of Sioux Falls, SD
identified as Exhibit E.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rol fing to approve the Regul ar Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

PUBLI C | NPUT

Sierra Broussard thanked Council Menbers Dean Karsky, G eg Jam son and Kenny
Anderson Jr. for taking the time to speak with her. She al so di scussed

enpl oynent discrimnation towards Native Anericans, the | ow grade Sioux Falls
recei ved regarding human trafficking, and problens with local hotels and

not el s.

Iltem 1 was discussed at this tine. See itemfor action taken.

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS



24,

25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

34.

Transfer of 2016 Retail Liquor License, including Sunday sal es and vi deo
lottery ternminals, from Pancakes and Morre, Inc., Oiginal Pancake House,
2715 West 41st Street, to MF Spot Inc., MF Spot Inc., on Lot 2, Block 2,
Brooks Crossing Addition to the City of Sioux Falls (general |ocation east
54th Street and Hosta Avenue) (full service restaurant; CUP not required).
Pendi ng pernit issuance and final inspections per Fire, Health and Buil ding
Servi ces.

Transfer of 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License from Marquette Council,
Kni ghts of Col unbus, 315 North Summit Avenue, to Cobra Ventures LLC,
Kni ghts of Col unbus, 315 North Summit Avenue.

New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for The Bakery LLC, The Bakery,
910 North Main Avenue (CUP not required).

New 2016 Retail Wne License for The Bakery LLC, The Bakery, 910 North Min
Avenue (CUP not required).

New 2016 Retail Wne License for Adive Destination Inc., Oive Destination,
720 South Hi ghline Place (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per
Heal th and Buil di ng Servi ces.

Rescind 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License, effective January 1, 2016,
for Dakotas Best East LLC, Dakotas Best Wne & Gfts, 4001 West 41st
Street, Suite 20.

New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage/ South Dakota Farm Wne License, effective
January 1, 2016, for Sioux Falls Wne & Gft, LLC, Sioux Falls Wne & Gft,
4001 West 41st Street, Suite 20 (CUP not required).

Rescind 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License, effective January 1, 2016,
for Catering Anerica Inc., Chef Dom niques Catering & Banquet Carpenter
Bui Il ding Ballroom 221 South Phillips Avenue, Suite 100.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering Arerica Inc., to be operated at 3901 North Lewis Avenue, for an
open house on Decenber 10, 2015

Speci al One-Day Package OFf-Sale Wne |license for Rotary West, Rotary West,
4712 East Alpine Crcle, for a fundraiser on Decenber 18, 2015.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering Anerica Inc., to be operated at The Carpenter Ballroom 221 South
Phillips Avenue, for a wedding on January 2, 2016.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach to approve Itens 24 through 34.



Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

| NTRODUCTI ON AND ADOPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

35. RECONSI DERATI ON ( FROM THE NOVEMBER 2, 2015, CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NG 2nd
Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF E. 41ST ST. AND S. VETERANS PKWY. FROM THE RA-
2 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL MODERATE DENSI TY AND C- 3 COMVERCI AL COVWMUNI TY
DI STRI CTS TO THE RA-3 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL H GH DENSI TY DI STRI CT,
PETI TI ON NO. 3456-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY
OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conm ssion recomends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
Rex Rolfing to adopt said O dinance 102-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

36. Deferred fromthe Cty Council Meeting on 11/17/15: 2nd Readi ng: AN
ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE COF ORDI NANCES
OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 39: PERSONNEL REGULATI ONS AND BENEFI TS;
RETI REMENT AND PENSI ONS; SECTI ON 39. 036 APPLI CATI ON TO APPO NTI VE OFFI CERS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to adopt said |tem 36.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Jam son and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to anend the ordi nance by addi ng, "appointed officer
within Fire or Police, or any other appointive officer"; and adding "This

provi sion does not apply to any appointive officer who has been renoved from
appoi ntive office for any reason that would warrant a denotion, suspension, or
di scharge of any enpl oyee who is subject to this chapter”

A friendly anmendnent was nmade by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded
by Council Menber Rex Rolfing to split the anendnent into two amendnents; and
to vote on "appointed officer within Fire or Police, or any other appointive
of ficer".

Vote on friendly amendnent: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Geg

Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Kermt L. Staggers, 5. Noes, Kenny Anderson
Jr., Mchelle Erpenbach, Rex Rolfing, 3.

Mbti on Passed.

Counci| Menber Christine M Erickson called point of order.



A friendly amendnent was nmade by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded
by Council Menber Rex Rolfing to vote on "This provision does not apply to any
appoi ntive officer who has been renoved from appointive office for any reason
that would warrant a denotion, suspension, or discharge of any enployee who is
subject to this chapter.”

A substitute notion was nmade by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by
Counci| Menber Dean Karsky to change the anendnent to "Any one hol ding an

appoi ntive office on or before Decenber 31, 2015, who at the tinme of his or her
appoi ntnment thereto, was in the civil service of the city shall, upon his or
her renoval from appointive office, be returned to his or her forner position
and pay as an enployee of the city, and the period of his or her tenure as an
appoi ntive officer shall be included in his or her civil service rights. This
provi sion does not apply to any appointive officer who has been renoved from
appoi ntive office for any reason that would warrant a denotion, suspension, or
di scharge of any enpl oyee who is subject to this chapter.”

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menmber Kenny Anderson Jr. to defer to Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m
Vote to defer: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

37. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY LOCATED S. OF W 85TH ST. AND W OF S. WESTERN AVE. FROM THE RS
SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT | NCLUDI NG CONDI TI ONS AS
ALLOWED | N SECTI ON 160. 650 (e) PLACI NG LI M TATI ONS ON REGULATI ONS W THI N
THE DD2 FORM TO THE RS S| NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT
| NCLUDI NG CONDI TI ONS AS ALLOWED I N SECTI ON 160. 650 (e) PLACI NG LI M TATI ONS
ON REGULATIONS WTHI N THE DD2 FORM PETI TI ON NO. 3669-2015, AND AMENDI NG
THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on
recomends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council

Menber Christine M Erickson to adopt said Odinance 114-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jami son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

38. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY AT 700 N. FRENCH AVE. FROM THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRICT TO THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL LOW
DENSI TY DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 3675-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG
MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conm ssi on recommends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council

Menmber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance 115-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.



39. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG
PROPERTY AT 800 S. SYCAMORE AVE. FROM THE O OFFI CE TO THE RA-1 APARTMENT
RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY, PETITI ON NO. 3676-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Counci l
Menmber Rex Rol fing to adopt said Ordinance 116-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

40. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG
PROPERTY AT THE SW CORNER OF W 12TH ST. AND S. DI SCOVERY AVE. FROM THE CN
CONSERVATI ON DI STRICT TO THE RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN
AND RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY, | NCLUDI NG CONDI TI ONS AS
ALLOWED | N SECTI ON 160. 650 (e) PLACI NG LI M TATI ONS ON REGULATI ONS W THI N
THE AD1 AND MD1 FORM PETI TI ON NO. 3238-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL
ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssi on recomends
approval with the following condition: 1) Buildings shall be no nore than
one story in height.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance 117-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt
L. Staggers, 8. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

41. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG
PROPERTY AT THE SE CORNER OF W 85TH ST. AND S. BRETT AVE. FROM THE AG
ACRI CULTURE DI STRI CT TO THE RA-2 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL MODERATE DENSI TY
DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 3665-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF
THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conm ssi on recommends approval .

Counci|l Menber Greg Jami son left the neeting at 8:36 p.m

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Dean Karsky to adopt said Item 41.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kermt L. Staggers, 1. Noes, Kenny
Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick
Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 6.
Motion Fail ed.
42. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATl ONS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. to adopt said Ordinance 119-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kernit L. Staggers,
7. Noes, 0.



Mot i on Passed.

43. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY TO REGULATE MOBI LE FOOD VENDORS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Counci l
Menber Rick Kiley to adopt said O dinance 118-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 5. MNoes, Kermt L. Staggers, 1. Council
Menber M chel |l e Er penbach was excused fromthe neeting and the vote on this
item

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 44:

44, 1st Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, DECLARI NG CERTAIN
PROPERTY OF THE CITY OF Sl QUX FALLS SURPLUS AND APPROVI NG AN OFFER BY THE
STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA TO PURCHASE REAL PROPERTY FROM THE CITY OF SI QUX
FALLS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Dean Karsky to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m for |tem 44,

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 6. Noes,
Kermt L. Staggers, 1.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 45:

45. 1st Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AVENDI NG CHAPTER 41: FEES.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item 45.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing. Noes,
Kermt L. Staggers, 1.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 46:

46. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 77: PARKI NG REGULATI ONS.



A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item 46.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chell e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
Staggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item47:

47. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, ESTABLI SHI NG THE
TAX | NCREMENT REVENUES TO BE COLLECTED AND AUTHORI ZI NG THE PAYMENT OF TAX
I NCREMENT REVENUES TO WASHI NGTON SQUARE PARTNERS, LLC, | N ACCORDANCE W TH
THE DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT FOR TAX | NCREMENTAL DI STRICT NO TWVENTY, CITY OF
SI QUX FALLS.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 8, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item47.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chell e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
St aggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 48:

48. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY ADOPTI NG THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL BUI LDI NG
CODEAND AMENDMENTS THERETO

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
Kenny Anderson Jr. to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for |tem 48.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
St aggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 49:

49. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY ADOPTI NG THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL RESI DENTI AL
BUI LDI NG CODE AND AMENDMENTS THERETO.

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for |tem 49.



Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chell e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
Staggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 50:

50. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY ADOPTI NG THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL EXI STI NG
BUI LDI NG CODEAND AMENDMENTS THERETO

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for |Item 50.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chell e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
St aggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item51:

51. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY ADOPTI NG THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL MECHANI CAL
CODE AND THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL FUEL GAS CODE AND AMENDMENTS THERETO

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item51.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
St aggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 52:

52. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY ADOPTI NG THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL PROPERTY
MAI NTENANCE CODE AND AMENDMENTS THERETO.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item52.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
Staggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.



Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p. m
for Item 53:

53. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY ELI M NATI NG THE MAXI MUM TWO- YEAR Tl ME PERI OD
FOR A HOVEOMNERS PLUMBI NG, MECHANI CAL, AND ELECTRI CAL PERM T; TO ELI M NATE
HOVEOMNER PERM TS FOR NEW HOUSES TO BE CONSI STENT W TH STATE RULE; AND TO
SET A 90- DAY TI ME PERI OD FROM THE DATE OF APPLI CATI ON TO ADM NI STER A
MECHANI CAL EXAM RESI DENTI AL CONSTRUCTI ON SUPERVI SOR EXAM ELECTRI CAL EXAM
AND A PLUMBI NG EXAM AND TO EXPAND THE OBLI GATI ON OF THE RESI DENTI AL
CONTRACTORS COVPLI ANCE BOND TO | NCLUDE FEES CHARGED BY PUBLI C WORKS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber M chelle Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, Decenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item 53.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M

Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L.
St aggers, 7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

54. A RESOLUTI ON REMOVI NG UNCCLLECTI BLE, DELI NQUENT ACCOUNTS FROM THE RECCRDS

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber M chel | e Erpenbach to adopt said Resol ution 120-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kernit L. Staggers,
7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 120-15

A RESOLUTI ON REMOVI NG UNCCLLECTI BLE, DELI NQUENT ACCOUNTS FROM THE RECORDS
WHEREAS, the City has attenpted by reasonabl e neans to collect the outstanding
accounts receivable on the belowlisted accounts; and

WHEREAS, the City considers the accounts outstanding for nore than one year to
be uncollectible for purposes of disclosing on the financial statenents of
the City; and

WHEREAS, the City will continue efforts to collect such uncollectible debt;
NOW THEREFORE, BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD

That pursuant to Section 30.028 of the Code of Ordinances of Sioux Falls, SD,
it hereby authorizes the renoval of the follow ng accounts as uncollectible and
aut hori zes the disclosure of the sane on the annual financial reports:

| Cust omer No. | Cust omer Nane | I nvoi ce Number | Amount |

| 681 | Warren Warehousing | 77519 | $ 36, 708.38 |

| 9176 | Rosal ee L. Rust | 85458 | 6, 245. 47

| 12647 | Di ana Ful | er | 133549 | 5, 062. 69

| 8919 | Di scount Gar bage | 114414, 115010, | 5,142. 92
|

| | | 115653, 116400, |



| CD131 | I nter-Tri bal | Housi ng
| | Cul tural Alliance | Loan

| CH88 [Hil1l, Kristol D. | Sheri ff
| CHO3 | West, Laura J. | Sheri ff
| CHO4 | Coughl i n, Tinothy | Sheri ff
| | and Jessi |

| CH105 | Bel |, Francine E. | Sheri ff
| CH336/ HH336 | Persing, Cassandra | Sheriff
| | J. |

| CH350 | Jacobs, Holly R | Sheri ff
| CH372/ HH372 | Kl ueber, Kay L. | Sheri ff
| HH10 | | Sheri f f
| | Peterson, B. Marjo |06

| HH13 | Moss, Monica L. | Sheri ff
| HH20 | Anderson, Kerri L. |Sheriff
| HH21 | Brandt, Sharon L. | Sheri ff
| HH30 | | Sheri f f
| | Hourscht, Brian L. |05

| HHA3 | Andersen, Ronald R | Sheriff
| | and Shelly A |

| HHE9 | Sobran, Brian C. | Sheri ff
| HH70 | Weaver, Brian S. and| Sheriff
| | Ashley R |

| HH76 | Rei man, Adeline S. | Sheriff
| HH147 | Fl eshner, Jodi D. | Sheri ff
| HH159 | Whi te, Nakeisha L. |Sheriff
| HH165 | Auringer, Paige C. |Sheriff
| HH175 | Garcia, Jeni L. | Sheri ff
| HH184 | Kel l ogg, Charles A | Sheriff
| HH185 | Guerra Sandoval , | Sheri ff
| | Edgar and Qui nonez,

| | Sandr a |

| HH229 | Csterman, Jacob J. | Sheriff
| HH237 | | Sheri f f
| | Boxwel |, Lorna K | 08

| HH268 | Si mpson, Elizabeth | Sheriff
| | M |

| HH288 | Peralta, Gaston and | Sheriff
| | El'i sama |

| HH487 | Morrison, Julie R | Sheriff
| HH500 | Chapin, Mchael W |Sheriff
| | and Jessica D. Lape

| HH716 | Chri sopul os, Steven | Sheriff
| |J. | 14

| NC799/ NC799A/ | | Sheri f f
| NC799B | Barger, Estella | 07

| NC845/ NC845A | Busse, Julie K | Sheri ff
| NC858/ NC858B | Skal I and, Kat hryn | Sheri ff
| NC866/ NCB66A | Bohl en, Lois L. | Sheri ff
| NC933 | Hof henke, Brenda A. | Sheriff
| 3/ 361 | Roose, Cathrine | Sheri ff
| 3/370-1, 3/370-2|Leichtman, John T. | Sheriff
| | and Marcia L. |

| 3/ 398 | Nel son, Ni kol e D. | Sheri ff
| Gand Tot al | |

| Pershi ng Buil di ng

| 117088, 118002, |
| 118760, 119530, |
| 120572, 121315 |

[Wility Billing |

Assi stance |

Sal e
Sal e
Sal e

Sal e
Sal e

Sal e
Sal e
Sal e

Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e

Sal e

Sal e
Sal e

Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e

Sal e

Sal e

Sal e

Sal e

Sal e
Sal e

Sal e

Sal e

Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e
Sal e

Sal e

|
9/ 11/ 07|

4/ 23/ 03]
5/ 28/ 08|

|
3/8/04 |
9/6/13 |

|
5/ 16/ 07|
4/ 20/ 11|
10/ 11/ |

|
6/ 29/ 11|
5/ 19/ 10|
9/ 19/ 08|
11/ 22/ |

|
12/ 8/ 04

|
9/7/05 |
6/ 24/ 04

|
5/ 20/ 04
7/ 16/ 03|
3/ 24/ 10|
2/ 271 08|
3/8/06 |
9/ 14/ 05|
4/ 9/ 04 |

|
7/ 20/ 10|

11/19/ |

|
6/1/05 |

|
8/ 10/ 05|

|
1/ 14/ 12|
1/ 20/ 10|

|
10/ 27/ |

|
10/ 15/ |

|
8/ 30/ 06|
8/ 12/ 12|
7/ 12/ 06|
8/ 18/ 10|
6/8/11 |
5/ 14/ 08|

|
7/ 29/ 11|

|
5, 344. 50|

12, 000. 00 |
|

7, 500. 00|
8, 000. 00|
8, 000. 00|

|

6, 500. 00|
5, 962. 50|

|

5, 101. 50|
5, 985. 00|
13, 800. 00 |
|

14, 411. 00 |
11, 361. 73 |
8, 697. 24|
13, 978. 00 |

|
5, 319. 00|

|
7, 669. 00|
8, 000. 00|

|
6, 886. 00|
6, 000. 00|
6, 000. 00|
5, 250. 00|
6, 000. 00|
8, 000. 00|
6, 000. 00|

|
6, 000. 00|

5, 625. 00|

|
5, 962. 50|

|
5, 962. 50|

|
7,837. 50|
8, 962. 50|

|
6, 000. 00|

|
16, 316. 00 |

|

13, 260. 75 |
8, 739. 28|
11, 503. 31 |
13, 331. 25 |
8, 427. 01
7,681. 07|

|
5,271. 61]

$375, 805. 21 |



Dat e adopted: 12/01/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

55. A RESOLUTI ON AMENDI NG THE 2015- 2019 CAPI TAL PROGRAM Concrete Pavenent
Restoration ($100,000); and Asphalt Street Rehabilitati on Program
($200, 000) .

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Kenny Anderson Jr. to adopt said Resolution 121-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kernit L. Staggers,
7. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 121-15

A RESOLUTI ON AMENDI NG THE 2015-2019 CAPI TAL PROGRAM

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That the 2015-2019 Capital Program shall be anended as foll ows:

Publ i c Works H ghways and Streets

Anend Capital |nprovenents Program Project No. 11001, Concrete Pavenent
Restoration, by increasing the anount of funding for construction by $100, 000
in 2015. The additional funding will require an increase in appropriations that
will be funded fromthe Sal es/Use Tax Fund unobligated fund bal ance.

Anmend Capital |nprovenents Program Project No. 11004, Asphalt Street
Rehabilitation Program by increasing the anount of funding for construction by
$200, 000 in 2015. The additional funding will require an increase in
appropriations that will be funded fromthe Sal es/Use Tax Fund unobligated fund
bal ance.

Dat e adopted: 12/01/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

REPORT OF OFFI CERS/ BOARDS/ COVM TTEES/ TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRI ATI ON
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS W THI N A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI T AS PROVI DED
IN THE SI OQUX FALLS C TY CHARTER SECTI ON 5. 07(d)



56. REPORT OF THE NOVEMBER 25, 2015, NOTICE OF TRANSFER OF APPROPRI ATI ONS
W TH N MAJOR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI TS.

NEW BUSI NESS

57. CONS| DERATI ON OF TRAVEL REQUEST FOR COUNCI LOR KENNY ANDERSON JR. TO ATTEND
THE 2016 GOVERNCOR S CONFERENCE ON TOURI SM I N PI ERRE, SOUTH DAKCTA.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kermit L. Staggers and seconded by Council
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to approve the travel request.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Christine M Erickson, Mchelle Erpenbach,
Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L. Staggers, 6. Noes, 0. Council
Menmber Kenny Anderson Jr. recused hinself fromthe neeting and the vote of this
item

Mbti on Passed.

ADJ OQURNMENT

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
Kenny Anderson Jr. to adjourn at 9:28 p.m

Mayor M ke Huether called for a voice vote. Al nenbers present voted yes.
Mbti on Passed.

Deni se D. Tucker, MVC
Assistant City Oerk

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOAN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCIL WLL ACT AS A DECI S| ON- MAKER ON AN UPCOM NG
MATTER | N\VOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE

WR TTEN COMMENTS TO THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COWMENT AT THE
PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM | S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE
WHO PROVI DE COMMENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMVENTS MAY
BECOME PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EWBY ALL PARTI ES AND THE
PUBLI C.

ADDRESS| NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM  PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON Cl TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COWM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE
FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

| NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NG, CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS Al R LI VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
TH RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M THE JO NT Cl TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY
COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5 P. M

REGULAR MEETI NGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCH VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR

VI EW NG ON DEMAND ATWAW S| OUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE



PCSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING G TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON CI TYLI NK.

CI TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETINGS AT 1:30 A M AND 9 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6 P. M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COWM TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8 A M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5 P.M ON SATURDAYS. CITY COUNCI L MEETI NGS AT 2: 30
AM AND 10 A°M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/

M NNEHAHA COUNTY COMM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8 A M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER LI VE

MEETI NG AND 1 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



