| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting

| M nut es

| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street

|| REGULAR MEETI NG OF Tuesday, Cctober 6, 2015, at 7 PM

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT OFFI Cl AL AGENDA

PRESENT ABSENT

Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach Counci| Menber Rick Kiley
Counci| Menber Greg Janison

Counci| Menber Dean Karsky

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers

Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr.

Counci | Menber Christine M Erickson

Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

e Council Menber Mchelle Erpenbach

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

PROCLANMATI ONS

« Donestic Violence Anareness Month - Cctober 2015

Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach took a nonent of personal privilege to renind
the City Council that on Thursday, COctober 8, 2015, from6 p.m 8 pmis
Take Back The Night at the A d Courthouse Museum 200 W 6th Street.

Assistant City Oerk Tanmara Jorgensen took a nonment of personal privilege to

wi sh her twin brother, Tinothy John Mller, (fromWtertown, SD), a happy

bi rt hday.

City Council Menber Christine M Erickson took a nonent of personal privilege
to acknowl edge the presence of two students from Rachael Kringens Advanced
Conmruni cations class fromthe Sioux Falls New Technol ogy H gh School .

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to approve the Consent Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, Geg Jani son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L. Staggers, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.



M NUTES

I nformati onal Meeting of Tuesday, Septenber 15, 2015, at 4 p.m

City Council Meeting of Tuesday, Septenber 15, 2015, at 7 p.m

I nformati onal Meeting of Tuesday, Septenber 22, 2015, at 4 p.m

COVMMUNI CATI ONS

Approval of contracts/agreenents on the Cctober 1, 2015, neno.

Approval of the notice of change orders on the Cctober 1, 2015, neno.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: August 21, 2015; #2 Cear

Di esel; 7,500 gallons; CHS, Inc. ($1.9899); Howe's Ol ($1.951); Harns Q I,
M dwest G| and Petrol eum Traders Co., all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howe's
al.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel dated: Septenber 2, 2015; #2 d ear
Diesel; 7,500 gallons; CHS, Inc. ($2.04); Howe's Ol ($2.045); Harns Q|
($2.0278); Mdwest G| and Petrol eum Traders Co., both no bid. Bid awarded
to: Harms Q.

Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel dated Septenber 16, 2015; #2 d ear
Di esel; 7,500 gallons; CHS, Inc. ($1.929); Harns O ($1.9375); Howe's QI
M dwest G| and Petrol eum Traders Co., all no bid. Bid awarded to: CHS, Inc.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: Septenber 22, 2015; Unl eaded
Et hanol ; 708 gal lons; M dway Service (%$2.1520); Howe's G| ($2.1370); Stern
G1l, no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Service.

Report of requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: Septenber 22, 2015; C ear
Di esel #1; 538 gallons; Mdway Service ($2.1810); Howe's G| ($2.3440);
Stern Gl, no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Service.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: Septenber 22, 2015; C ear
Di esel #2; 538 gallons; Mdway Service ($1.9130); Howe's G| ($1.9940);
Stern Gl, no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Service.

Report of Requests for Fuel dated: Septenber 25, 2015; #2 Dyed Diesel Fuel;
7,500 gallons; Howe's G| ($1.6545); Harms O | ($1.6690); Cole's Petrol eum
($1.7320); CHS, Inc., Mdwest G, and Oson G, all no bid. Bid awarded
to: Howe's Q.



APPLI CATI ONS

10. Special One-Day Liquor License for Prairie Pasta Inc., Johnny Carinos to
be operated at the Army National GQuard Arnory, 801 West National Guard
Drive, for a wedding on Cctober 10, 2015.

11. Special One-Day Liquor License for Washi ngton Pavilion Managenent Inc., to
be operated at Washington Pavilion of Arts & Science, 301 South Main
Avenue, for special events on Cctober 10 and 16, 2015.

12. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering America Inc., Chef Dom niques Catering, to be operated at the AOd
Court house Museum 200 West 6th Street, for a holiday party on Decenber 4,
2015.

The foll owi ng abatenent was reconmended for denial by the Director of
Equal i zation and the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for Mnnehaha County; and the
City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

13. Joseph Il and Ann Henkin, 5212 Summerfield Place. Since this itemis
deni ed, no dollar anount available at this tine.

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Monday, COctober 19, 2015, at 7 p.m for Itens 14
t hr ough 20:

14. New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for Jackys Restaurant LLC, to be
operated at Jacky s Restaurant, 1301 East Benson Road (CUP not required).

15. New 2015 Retail Wne License for Jackys Restaurant LLC, to be operated at
Jacky s Restaurant, 1301 East Benson Road (CUP not required).

16. Transfer of 2015 Retail Liquor License, with Sunday sales certificate, from
Dave Kulish, Martini s Casino & Lounge, 4823 South Loui se Avenue, to US
Hot el and Resort Managenent Inc., 2320 South Loui se Avenue (CUP not
required).

17. New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License, with video lottery termnals, for
Mz G| Conpany, to be operated at Happy Jacks Sioux Falls |1, 4823 South
Loui se Avenue (CUP not required).

18. Special One-Day Malt Beverage, Special One-Day Wne and Speci al One-Day
O f-Sal e Package Wne Deal er Licenses for the Multi-Cultural Center of
Sioux Falls to be operated at 515 North Main Avenue, for a fundraiser on
Decenber 5, 2015.

19. Special One-Day Wne License for the Denocratic Forumto be operated at the
Hi story Club, 758 South Phillips Avenue, for a fundrai ser on Novenber 12,
2015.



20. Transfer of 2015 Retail Liquor License, including Sunday sales certificate,
from WP of Sioux Falls LLC, WP of Sioux Falls LLC, |ocated on Lot 9A,
Bl ock 17, Daw ey Farm Village Addition, to WeP of Sioux Falls LLC, Buffalo
WIld Wngs, 2601 South Loui se Avenue, #100 (full service restaurant, CUP
not required).

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Counci
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to approve the Regul ar Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, Geg Jani son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rolfing, Kermt L. Staggers, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

PUBLI C | NPUT

Dor een Wi nstei n spoke about her position on boul evard planting.

Scott Ehrisman spoke about: the audit of the Great Plains Zoo and Del bridge
Museum the Mayor running for another office; and the new downtown parKking

ranp.

Cat hy Brechtel shauer spoke regarding the value of public facilities and
servi ces

Bruce Dani el son spoke regardi ng: street markings on West 9th Street; the
selling of the Iand on North Philips Avenue and typographical errors on
docunents; the Railroad Relocation project; and the Events Center buil ding
processes.

W1 liam Mourer spoke regarding an incident he had with the Sioux Falls Police
Depart nment.

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS

21. Transfer of 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License, including video lottery
termnals, fromHonefield Gaming Inc., Royal Casino, 4601 East Arrowhead
Par kway, Suite 109, to MG G| Conpany, Happy Jacks 5, 4601 East Arrowhead
Par kway, Suite 109 (CUP not required).

22. Transfer of 2015-16 Package Malt Beverage License from Melinda Koppi en



Park Ridge Gas N Pak, 1801 South Western Avenue, to Scott Bowar, Park Ridge
Gas N Gub, 1801 South Western Avenue (CUP not required).

Counci|l Menber Kermit L. Staggers left the neeting at 7:30 p.m

23. New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for Bold Behavior, LLC, Bold
Behavi or, 4805 South Loui se Avenue (CUP not required).

24. New 2015 Retail Wne License for Bold Behavior, LLC, Bold Behavior, 4805
Sout h Loui se Avenue (CUP not required).

25. W THDRAWN PER APPLI CANT REQUEST: Speci al One-Day Malt Beverage and Speci al
One-Day Wne Licenses for Catering America Inc., Chef Dom niques Catering,
to be operated at Vance Thonpson Vision, 3101 West 57th Street, for
custoner appreciation on Cctober 8, 2015.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Christine M Erickson to withdraw Item 25.

Vote to withdraw. Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Janison, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

26. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering Anerica Inc., Chef Donminiques Catering, to be operated at 2601
Latigo Circle, for a private social on Cctober 30, 2015.

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to approve Itens 21 through 24, and Item 26.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, Geg Jani son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

27. Deferred fromthe Gty Council Meetings on 4/21/15, 6/2/15 and 8/4/15: 2nd
Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
E. AND W OF N MARLOWAVE. AND N. OF E. PADDI NGTON ST. FROM THE AG
ACRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO THE RS, SINGLE-FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN
DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO. 2249-2015 AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE
CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. The Pl anni ng Conmi ssion reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to defer this itemto the City Council Meeting on Mnday,
Cct ober 19, 2015, at 7 p.m



Vote to defer: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

28. Deferred fromthe Gty Council Meeting on 8/4/15: 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE
OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY SQUTH OF E. BENSON RD.
AND EAST COF 1-229 FROM THE AG AGRI CULTURE AND CN CONSERVATI ON DI STRICTS TO
THE 1-2 HEAVY | NDUSTRI AL AND CN CONSERVATI ON DI STRI CTS, PETI TION NO. 2895-
2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS.

Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to withdraw Item 28.

Vote to withdraw. Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Janm son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

29. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY AMENDI NG THE FEES SUBCHAPTER OF CHAPTER 95 PARKS
AND RECREATION. This is a second reading of an ordi nance that is expected
to be postponed indefinitely; an alternative proposal shall be up for first
readi ng on Tuesday, Cctober 13, 2015, and a second readi ng and public input
expected to be held on Monday, Cctober 19, 2015.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rolfing to postpone this itemindefinitely.

Vote to postpone indefinitely: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, Geg
Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rex Rolfing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
6. Noes, 0.

Mbti on Passed.

30. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG PROPERTY
BETWEEN S. NORTON AVE. AND VACATED S. DULUTH AVE. AND W 39TH ST. AND W
41ST ST. FROM THE RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT AND
C- 2 COWMVERCI AL NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR DI STRICT TO THE G-

4 COMVERCI AL REG ONAL DI STRI CT, | NCLUDI NG CONDI TI ONS AS ALLOWED | N SECTI ON
160. 650 (e) PLACI NG LI M TATI ONS ON REGULATI ONS AND ADDI NG ADDI TI ONAL

TRANSI TI ONAL REQUI REMENTS W THIN THE RE5 FORM PETI TI ON NO. 2541-2015, AND
AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anning

Conmi ssi on reconmends approval with the follow ng stipulations which have
been added to the ordinance: 1) An alternative site plan including detailed
buffer yard plans be approved by the Pl anni ng Comi ssion; 2) The proposed
113 enpl oyee parking spaces (61 within the new parking | ot and 52 behind
the existing Billion Auto-Kia building) will be permanently marked and
reserved for Billion enployees only; and 3) Uses will be Iimted to outdoor
not or vehicle sales and di splay and associ ated enpl oyee parking areas. An
anmendnent has been proposed for Item 3) addi ng the sentence, "Construction
of buildings is prohibited."

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council



Menber Dean Karsky to adopt said Ordi nance No. 93-15.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Jam son and seconded by Council Menber
Dean Karsky to anend this itemby adding to 3) "Construction of buildings is
prohi bi ted".

Vote to anend: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

Vote to adopt, as anended: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, Geg Jam son,
Dean Karsky, Rex Rolfing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes,
0.

Mbti on Passed.

31. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG PROPERTY
AT 4605 S. LOU SE AVE. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN
DI STRICT TO THE O OFFI CE DI STRICT, PETITION NO. 3236-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE
OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssion
recomends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Christine M Erickson and seconded by
Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. to adopt said O dinance No. 94-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

32. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
SQUTHWEST OF GREAT BEAR RECREATI ON AREA FROM THE AG ACRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO
THE RS S| NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT, PETI TION NO. 3271- 2015,
AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS. Pl anni ng
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to defer this itemto the City Council Meeting on Mnday,
Cct ober 19, 2015, at 7 p.m

Vote to defer: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

33. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG PROPERTY
AT 4800 S. LOU SE AVE. FROM THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY
DI STRICT TO THE G2 COWERCI AL NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR DI STRI CT,
PETI TI ON NO. 3285-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF
SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Commi ssion recommends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council



Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance No. 95-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

34. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZON NG PROPERTY
AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF W 12TH ST. AND S. DI SCOVERY AVE. FROM THE CN
CONSERVATI ON DI STRICT TO THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY
DI STRI CT, | NCLUDI NG CONDI TI ONS AS ALLOWED | N SECTI ON 160. 650 (e) PLACI NG
LI M TATI ONS ON REGULATI ONS WTHI N THE MD1 FORM PETI TI ON NO. 3238-2015, AND
AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anning
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval (4-2) with the followi ng stipulation which
has been added to the ordinance: 1) Buildings shall be no nore than one
story in height.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rolfing to defer this itemto the City Council Meeting on Mnday,
Cct ober 19, 2015, at 7 p.m

Vote to defer: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on None.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Cctober 13, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 35:

35. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE
CODE OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY REPEALI NG SUBCHAPTER ULTI MATE FI GHTI NG
OF CHAPTER 113 AMJSEMENTS AND SECTI ON 131. 006 ULTI MATE FI GHTI NG,
CONTEST OR EXHI BI Tl ONS.
A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for
Tuesday, October 13, 2015, at 7 p.m for |Item 35.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rolfing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on None.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, Cctober 13, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 36:

36. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SIQUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS. Hi ghways and Streets ($3,110,000.); Parks and
Recreation ($1,597,000.), and Police ($690, 000.).

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
Cct ober 13, 2015, at 7 p.m for Item 36.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.



Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Monday, Novenber 2, 2015, at 7 p.m
for Item 37:

37. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDNI G THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY REVI SI NG CHAPTER 124: VEH CLES FOR H RE
PERTAI NI NG TO TRANSPORTATI ON NETWORK COVPANI ES AND AMENDI NG THE TI TLE OF
CHAPTER 124 TO READ TRANSPORTATI ON SERVI CES

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
Greg Janison to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Monday, Novenber 2,
2015, at 7 p.m for Item 37.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean
Karsky, Rex Rolfing, Christine M Erickson, 5. Noes, Kenny Anderson Jr., 1.
Mbti on Passed.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

38. A RESOLUTION OF THE G TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE PLACEMENT OF TWO
SCULPTURES ON PUBLI C PROPERTY.

A notion was made by Council Menber Greg Jam son and seconded by Council Menber
Kenny Anderson Jr. to adopt said Resolution No. 98-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 98-15

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE PLACEMENT OF TWO
SCULPTURES ON PUBLI C PROPERTY.

WHEREAS, the Sioux Falls Visual Arts Comni ssion encourages and recommends the
exhibition of public art in Sioux Falls, SD; and

VWHEREAS, the Scul ptureWal k 2010 Peoples Choice Award is a City-owned bronze
scul pture known as Flower Dancing in the Wnd, designed and constructed by
artist Jerry MKellar from Wshi ngton; and

VWHEREAS, the scul pture depicts a Native Anerican woman dancing in the wind and
measures approximately 5 1/2° in height, 77 in width, and 5 in length; and
VWHEREAS, the proposed outdoor placenent is at the Washi ngton Pavilion of Arts
and Sciences within a portion of the Pal adi no- Hohm Scul pture Garden in the
sout heast corner near a waterfall feature along Main Ave.; and

VWHEREAS, the Scul ptureWal k 2014 Peoples Choice Award is a City-owned bronze
scul pture known as Worlds Her Canvas, designed and constructed by artists
Sherri Treeby and Lee Leuni ng from South Dakota; and

VWHEREAS, the scul pture depicts a young painter visualizing her artwork and
measures approximately 45" in height, 36" in width, and 42" in length; and
WHEREAS, the proposed indoor placenent at the Washington Pavilion of Arts and
Sciences is within the main | obby at the north grand staircase al cove; and
WHEREAS, the Sioux Falls Visual Arts Conmmi ssion reviewed both scul ptures and
their respective placenents on August 18, 2015, and unani nously recomended
approval for both scul pture placenents at the Washington Pavilion of Arts and



Sci ences as present ed;

NOW THEREFORE, BE I T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That the scul ptures, Flower Dancing in the Wnd and Wrlds Her Canvas, and
their respective outdoor and indoor placenents at the Washi ngton Pavilion of
Arts and Sci ences be approved as recomended.

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

39. A RESOLUTION OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
COPPER CREEK ESTATES ADDI Tl ON.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Resolution No. 99-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 99-15

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
COPPER CREEK ESTATES ADDI TI ON.

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That the prelinnary plan of Copper Creek Estates Addition to the Gty of Sioux
Falls, M nnehaha County, SD, is hereby approved, and the Gty Cerk of the Gty
of Sioux Falls is hereby directed to endorse on such plan a copy of this
resolution and certify the sane thereon.

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

40. A RESOLUTI ON | NCLUDI NG CERTAI' N CONTI GUOUS TERRI TORY W THI N THE CORPORATE

LIMTS OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD. ANNEXATI ON 3150- 2015 BARBERS AND
KNOBLOCHS ADDI T1 ONS.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council



Menber Greg Jami son to adopt said Resolution No. 100-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 100-15

ANNEXATI ON 3150- 2015 BARBERS AND KNOBLOCHS ADDI TI ONS
A RESOLUTI ON | NCLUDI NG CERTAI N CONTI GUOUS TERRI TORY W THI N THE CORPCRATE LIM TS
OF THE G TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.
WHEREAS, there has been presented to the Cty Council of the City of Sioux
Falls and filed with the Cty Cerk, a Petition in witing signed by the owners
and otherwi se in conpliance with the provisions of SDCL Chapter 9-4, requesting
that the territory hereinafter described be included within the nmunicipality;
VWHEREAS, there has been an analysis conpleted in regard to the territory
herei nafter described and it has been found that:

1. The property has been properly described and is contiguous to the current
city linmts.

2. The proposed | and uses and densities are consistent with the Shape Sioux
Fal I s 2035 Conprehensive Pl an.

3. There is access to the nmmjor street network once streets are extended from
t he devel opnent to the east and adequate provisions for nunicipa
utilities once water and sanitary sewer are extended fromS. Sycanore Ave.

NOW THEREFORE, BE I T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That the foll owi ng described properties are and the sane hereby are incl uded
within the corporate limts of the city of Sioux Falls, Lincoln County, SD, and
the boundary of the city is hereby extended to include such territory:

Tract 1 Barber s Addition and Tract 1 Knoblochs Addition in Section 7-T100N
R49W all in Lincoln County, SD

And that the City Cerk shall cause to be filed with the Regi ster of Deeds,

Li ncoln County, SD, a duly certified transcript of this resolution.

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

41. A RESOLUTI ON | NCLUDI NG CERTAI' N CONTI GUOUS TERRI TORY W THI N THE CORPORATE
LIMTS OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SOUTH DAKOTA. ANNEXATI ON 3232-2015 -
MADI SON & VETERANS PARKWAY.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Resolution No. 101-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.



Mot i on Passed.
RESOLUTI ON NO. 101-15

ANNEXATI ON 3232-2015 MADI SON AND VETERANS PARKWAY
A RESOLUTI ON | NCLUDI NG CERTAI N CONTI GUOUS TERRI TORY W THI N THE CORPCRATE LIM TS
OF THE G TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.
WHEREAS, there has been presented to the City Council of the City of Sioux
Falls and filed with the Cty Cerk, a Petition in witing signed by the owners
and otherwi se in conpliance with the provisions of SDCL Chapter 9-4, requesting
that the territory hereinafter described be included within the nmunicipality;
VWHEREAS, there has been an analysis conpleted in regard to the territory
herei nafter described and it has been found that:

1. The property has been properly described and is contiguous to the current
city linmts.

2. The proposed | and uses and densities are generally consistent with the
Shape Sioux Falls 2035 Conprehensive Pl an.

3. There is access to the najor street network once E. 6th St. and E. Madi son
St. are extended to the devel opnent and adequate provisions for nunicipa
utilities once water is extended fromthe west. Sanitary sewer currently
runs through the subject property.

NOW THEREFORE, BE I T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That the foll owi ng described properties are and the sane hereby are incl uded
within the corporate limts of the city of Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD,
and the boundary of the city is hereby extended to include such territory.

The WL/2 NW/4 (EX HL, H6, H6, H7, H7, & H8) and the N16.5 W/2 SW/4 (EX H3 &
H4) and the NWL/4 SWL/4 (EX N16.5 & EX Hl, H2, H3, & H4) and incl uding

adj acent unannexed right-of-way, Section 18-T101N-RA9W M nnehaha County, SD
And that the City Cerk shall cause to be filed with the Regi ster of Deeds,

M nnehaha County, SD, a duly certified transcript of this resolution.

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

42. A RESOLUTI ON AUTHORI ZI NG USE OF CONTRUCTI ON MANAGER AT RI SK SERVI CES FOR
THE CONSTRUCTI ON OF A M XED USE DEVELOPMENT | NCLUDI NG PRI VATE DEVELOPMENT
AND A PARKI NG RAMP AT THE CORNER OF TENTH STREET AND MALL AVENUE.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menmber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Resolution No. 104-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 104- 15

A RESCLUTI ON AUTHORI ZI NG USE OF CONSTRUCTI ON MANAGER AT RI SK SERVI CES FOR THE
CONSTRUCTI ON OF A M XED USE DEVELOPMENT | NCLUDI NG PRI VATE DEVELOPMENT AND A



PARKI NG RAMP AT THE CORNER OF TENTH STREET AND MALL AVENUE.

VWHEREAS, in order to have an integrated team approach to the planning, design,
and construction of the m xed use devel opnent at the corner of Tenth Street and
Mal I Avenue including private devel opnent and a nmj or new public parking ranp,
to help control schedul e and budget, and to help ensure quality for the Cty,
the Citys Director of Public Wrks recommends the project be acconplished
usi ng the Construction Manager at Risk delivery method.

NOW THEREFORE, BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD

That it is in the best interest of the public to utilize the Construction
Manager at Ri sk project delivery nethod for the nmixed use devel opnent at the
corner of Tenth Street and Mall Avenue including private devel opnent and a new
public parking ranp and that the Constructi on Manager at Risk be allowed to
submit bids on portions of the work.

BE | T FURTHER RESCOLVED t hat the Construction Manager at Ri sk services woul d not
unreasonably duplicate and would be in addition to the nornmal scope of separate
architect or engineer contracts.

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

43. A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS TO G FT A 3" WATER METER TO THE
CI TY OF DELMONT, SOUTH DAKCTA.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Counci
Menmber Dean Karsky to adopt said Resolution No. 102-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Mchelle Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky,
Rex Rol fing, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson, 6. Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 102-15

A RESOLUTI ON AUTHORI ZI NG THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS TO A FT A THREE- | NCH WATER
METER TO THE CI TY OF DELMONT, SD

VWHEREAS, Sioux Falls Public Wrks has declared as surplus a three-inch water
neter; and

VWHEREAS, the City of Delnont, SD, finds it desirable to acquire the above-
descri bed surplus property;

NOW THEREFORE, BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD

That the gifting by the City of Sioux Falls to the City of Delnont, SD, of the
foll owi ng surplus property:

e Three-inch Water Meter

i s hereby approved.

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15



M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

44, A RESOLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO

CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

A notion was made

by Council Menber

Kenny Anderson Jr.

and seconded by Counci l

Menber Christine M Erickson to adopt said Resolution No. 103-15.

Vote to adopt:
Rex Rol fing,
Mbti on Passed.

Rol |
Kenny Anderson Jr.,

Cal | : Yeses,

M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son,
Christine M Erickson, 6.

Noes, O.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 103-15

A RESCLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND @ VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.
BE I T RESOCLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD:

That

Name
Scott Bartlett

Janes Kel | ar
Joyeuse Urwi butso
Dr. Bruce Vogt
Lyl e Pudwi ||
Davi d Syverson

George Hanilton

Ri chard Scott

it gives its advice and consent to the foll owi ng Mayor al

Boar d
Board of Health

Falls Conmunity Health Center
Gover ni ng Board
Falls Conmunity Health Center
Gover ni ng Board

Falls Conmunity Health Center
Gover ni ng Board

Mai n Street Business

| nprovenent District Board
Mai n Street Business

| nprovenent District Board
Property Mai ntenance Board of

Appeal s

Property Mai ntenance Board of
Appeal s

Dat e adopted: 10/06/15 .

M ke T. Huet her

Mayor

ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad
Cty derk

appoi nt ments:

Term

Reappointed for a termfrom
Cct ober 2015 to COctober 2018.
Reappointed for a termfrom
Cct ober 2015 to COctober 2018.
Appointed for a termfrom
Cct ober 2015 to May 2017 (to
fill the unexpired term of
Steve Mller).

Reappointed for a termfrom
Cct ober 2015 to COctober 2018.

Reappointed for a termfrom

Cct ober 2015 to October 2018.

Reappointed for a termfrom

Cct ober 2015 to COctober 2018.
Appointed for a termfrom
Cct ober 2015 to COctober 2018
(to replace Dawn d ausen).
Appointed for a termfrom
Cct ober 2015 to COctober 2018
(to replace Ron Rensberger).

Dean Kar sky,



REPORT OF OFFI CERS/ BOARDS/ COVM TTEES/ TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRI ATI ON
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS W THI N A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI T AS PROVI DED
IN THE SI OQUX FALLS C TY CHARTER SECTI ON 5. 07(d)

45. REPORT OF THE OCTOBER 1, 2015, NOTI CE OF TRANSFER OF APPROPRI ATI ONS W THI N
MAJOR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNITS.

ADJ OQURNMENT

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by
Counci| Menber Christine M Erickson to adjourn the neeting at 8:
50 p.m Mayor Huether called for a voice vote. Al nenbers voted
yes.
Mot i on

Passed.
Tamara Jorgensen, NMMC
Assistant City Oerk

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOAN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCIL W LL ACT AS A DECI S| ON- MAKER ON AN UPCOM NG
MATTER | N\VOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE

WR TTEN COMMENTS TO THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COWMENT AT THE
PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM | S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE
WHO PROVI DE COMMENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMVENTS MAY
BECOME PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EWBY ALL PARTI ES AND THE
PUBLI C.

ADDRESS| NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM  PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON Cl TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COWM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE
FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

| NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NG, CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS Al R LI VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
TH RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M THE JO NT Cl TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY
COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5 P. M

REGULAR MEETI NGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCH VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR

VI EW NG ON DEMAND ATWAW S| OUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON Cl TYLI NK.

Cl TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS AT 1:30 A M AND 9 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6 P.M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COMM TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8 A'M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5 P.M ON SATURDAYS. Cl TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS AT 2:30
AM AND 10 A.M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JO NT Cl TY COUNCI L/

M NNEHAHA COUNTY COMM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8 A'M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER LI VE
MEETING AND 1 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



