| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| M nut es |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
|| MEETI NG OF Tuesday, March 17, 2015, at 7:00 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT OFFI Cl AL AGENDA

PRESENT ABSENT

Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers
Counci | Menber Christine M Erickson

Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach

Counci| Menber Greg Janison

Counci| Menber Dean Karsky

Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

* Mnister David Kraener, Al Souls Unitarian Universalist Church
PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to approve the Consent Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

M NUTES

e Informational Meeting of Tuesday, March 10, 2015, at 4:00 p.m
e« City Council Meeting of Tuesday, March 10, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
COVMUNI CATI ONS

1. Approval of contracts/agreenents on the March 12, 2015 neno.



A conmuni cati on was received from Avera Health requesting permission to
consune, but not sell, wine and nalt beverages at Avera Health, 3900 W
Avera Drive, on Mnday, March 30, 2015 from4:30 p.m to 6:00 p.m pursuant
to SDCL 35-1-5.5. The purpose is a nixer hosting the South Dakota Biotech
Associ ati on.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 3, 2015; E-10 Unl eaded
Et hanol / 87 Cctane; 8,500 gallons; Harns Q| ($2.0324); Howes Q| ($2.0580);
CHS, Inc., Cole’'s Petroleum and Ason G1l, all no bid. Bid awarded to:
Harms Q| .

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 4, 2015; E-10 Unl eaded
Et hanol / 87 Cctane; 8,500 gallons; Howes O ($2.0350); Cole's Petrol eum
($2.0378); Harnms G| ($2.0530); CHS, Inc. ($2.1200); dson G, no bid. Bid
awarded to: Howes QO I.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 4, 2015; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 7,500 gallons (3,750 gallons each #1 & #2); Harns Q| ($2.2212
#1 & $2.0522 #2); Cole’'s Petrol eum ($2.2965 #1 & $2. 0725 #2); CHS, Inc.,
Howes O, Mdwest OI, dson Ol, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harnms Q.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 4, 2015; 50/50 Dyed
Di esel ; 3,000 gallons; Howes Q1| ($2.429); Mdwest Ol (%$2.299); Stern Q|
($2.3986). Bid awarded to Mdwest O I.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 5, 2015; #2 d ear

Di esel; 8,003 gallons; CHS, Inc. ($2.26); Howes O ($2.1715); Petroleum
Traders Co. ($2.247); Harms G| and Mdwest G|, both no bid. Bid awarded
to: Howes Q.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 10, 2015; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 15,000 gallons (7,500 gallons each #1 & #2); Harns O ($2.1137
#1 & $1.9537 #2); Cole's Petroleum CHS, Inc., Howes G|, Mdwest Ol and
Oson G, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harns QO |.

APPLI CATI ONS

The foll owi ng abatenents were recommended for approval by the Director of
Equal i zation and the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for Mnnehaha County; and the
City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

9. Rick Wbeto, 705 W MdCellan Street, for 2014 property taxes in the anount

of $531.46. The owner-occupi ed status was renoved in error.

10. Fred Blom 6520 Verbena Street, for 2014 property taxes in the amount of $

880. 79. The owner-occupi ed status was renoved in error.



11. City of Sioux Falls, 224 W 9th Street, for 2014 property taxes in the
amount of $439.19. City purchased property at W5 8 Block 1 Harrison's
Addition to the Gty of Sioux Falls on May 30, 2014.

12. City of Sioux Falls, 224 W 9th Street, for 2014 property taxes in the
amount of $587.93. The City purchased the property at W 50.5 1, 2 & E
8.7 8 Block 1 Harrisons Addition to the City of Sioux Falls on May 30,
2014.

13. Pettigrew Partners, LLC, 216 S. Duluth Ave., for 2014 property taxes in the
amount of $858.50. The house was razed on June 16, 2014.

14. Lyle K Krejci, 709 N. Prairie Avenue, for 2014 property taxes in the
amount of $156.98. The house was razed on August 14, 2014.

Itens 15-20: The anmpunt requested is the difference between the elderly freeze
and the non-elderly freeze.

15. Agnes Meyer, 705 S. Gardner Drive, for 2014 taxes in the anount of $524. 80.

The amount requested is the difference between the elderly freeze and the
non-el derly freeze.

16. Sanuel E. Marks, 5401 W 15th Street, for 2014 property taxes in the anount
of $377.02.

17. Earlien Gavin, 1824 S. Euclid Avenue, for 2014 property taxes in the anmount
of $650. 31.

18. Rosemary F. Hammond, 3004 S. Carter Place, for 2014 property taxes in the
anmount of $33. 83.

19. Lois A Merritt, 3004 S. 10th Avenue, for 2014 property taxes in the anmount
of $966. 75.

20. Gertrude A France, 3013 S. WIIlow Avenue, for 2014 property taxes in the
anmount of $500. 07.

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for Itens 21
t hrough 28

21. New 2014-15 Retail Malt Beverage License for JLB-SF2 Inc., JL Beers, to be
operated at 3623 South Western Avenue (CUP not required).

22. New 2015 Retail Wne License for JLB-SF2, Inc., JL Beers, to be operated at
3623 South Western Avenue (CUP not required).



23. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering America Inc., Chef Donminiques, to be operated at Avera Prairie
Center, 1000 East 23rd Street, for a retirenent social on April 9, 2015.

24. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering Arerica Inc., Chef Dominiques, to be operated at Avera eCare,
4500 North Lewi s Avenue, for a social event on April 9, 2015.

25. Special One-Day Liquor License for Ovations Food Services, LP, Sioux Falls
Convention Center, to be operated at Sanford Research Center, 2301 East
60th Street North, for a dinner on April 15, 2015.

26. Special One-Day Liquor License requests for Hy-Vee Inc., Al QOccasions by
Hy-Vee, to be operated at The Point is to Serve Church, 506 North Kiwanis
Avenue, for weddings on April 18 and 25, 2015.

27. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for the
Sioux Falls Jazz & Blues Society, to be operated at Yankton Trail Park,
3901 South M nnesota Avenue, for the Jazz Fest on July 16-18, 2015.

28. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for the
Sioux Falls Jazz & Blues Society, to be operated at Vern Eide Acura, 4030
Sout h Grange Avenue, for a fundraiser on Septenber 12, 2015.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menmber Kenny Anderson Jr. to approve the Regul ar Agenda.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

PUBLI C | NPUT

Four students from Explorer Elenentary Third Grade class addressed the City
Counci | .

Roger El gersma spoke regardi ng regul ation of food trucks downt own.

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS



29. Transfer of a 2015 Retail Liquor license, including Sunday sales, from
Nutty s Inc., Boonies Bar and Bar B. Q, 805 North Wst Avenue, to Bl ue
Cherry LLC, Ode to Food and Drinks, 300 North Cherapa Place, Suite 102
(full service restaurant; CUP not required).

30. New 2015 Retail Wne License for Body Scul pting Day Spa |Inc., Body
Scul pting Day Spa to be operated at 5026 South Marion Road (CUP not
required).

31. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for the
Brennan Rock & Roll Acadeny, 900 West 11th Street, for a fundraiser concert
on March 27, 2015.

32. Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Avera McKennan Hospital to be
operated at the Avera MKennan Fitness Center, 3400 South Southeastern
Avenue, for a Joker Run on April 1, 2015.

33. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for the
Sioux Falls Area Comunity Foundation to be operated at Raven Industries,
205 East Sixth Street, for a fundraiser on May 7, 2015.

34. Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for South
Dakota Associ ation of the Deaf (SDAD) to be operated at 3520 Gateway Lane,
for a SDAD Conference/ 115th Birthday on June 19 and 20, 2015.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Rick Kiley to approve Itens 29 through 34.

Vote to approve: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

35. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF SAID CITY BY CHANG NG A STREET NAME. (West Hanger Street
to West Hangar Street)

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to adopt said Odinance No. 24-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Greg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

36. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE



OF ORDI NANCES OF SAID CITY BY CHANG NG A STREET NAME. (North John Or Drive
to North Knapp Brown Drive)

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Rick Kiley to adopt said O dinance No. 25-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

37. 2nd Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY REVI SI NG CHAPTER 111, ALCOHOLI C BEVERAGES.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Rex Rolfing to adopt said Ordinance No. 26-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

38. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE
NAM NG OF A FACI LI TY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. (C ub Canbri a)

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Dean Karsky to adopt said Odinance No. 27-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, March 24, at 5:00 p.m at
the Joint Cty Council/ M nnehaha County Meeting for Item 39:

39. 1st Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 1310 N. ELLIS RD. FROM THE A-1 AGRICULTURE DI STRICT TO THE I|-1 LIGHT
| NDUSTRI AL DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 15-03, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG
MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. The Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmmends
approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, March
24, 2015, at 5:00 p.m at the Joint Cty Council/M nnehaha County Meeting for

Item 39.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Greg Janm son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex
Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.



Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
for Item 40:

40. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF W 26TH ST. AND S. KATIE AVE. FROM THE RS
SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT TO THE RA-1 APARTMENT
RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY DI STRI CT, PETI TION NO. 2223-2015, AND AVENDI NG THE
OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS. The Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on
recomends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April
7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for |tem 40.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Geg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex
Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
for Item 41:

41. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 1116 S. 4TH AVE. FROM THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL TRADI Tl ONAL
DI STRICT TO THE S-1 GENERAL | NSTI TUTI ONAL DI STRI CT, PETITI ON NO 2243-2015,
AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. The
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Dean Karsky and seconded by Council Menber
Rex Rolfing to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7,
2015, at 7:00 p.m for Item41.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Greg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex
Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
for Item 42:

42. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 633 W 10TH ST. FROM THE RT-2 TOMMHOVE RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRI CT
TO THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 2286-
2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI CI AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. The
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April
7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for ltem42.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Greg Janm son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex



Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.
Mot i on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
for Item 43:

43. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 3204 S. WEST AVE. FROM THE RD-1 TW N HOVE/ DUPLEX RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN
DI STRICT TO THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRI CT,
PETI TI ON NO. 2287-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF
SI QUX FALLS. The Pl anni ng Conmi ssion reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Rick Kiley and seconded by Council Menber
M chel | e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April
7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for |ltem 43.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Geg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex
Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
for Item 44:

44, 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
NORTH OF E. 41ST ST. AND WEST OF S. SIX MLE RD. FROM THE AG AGRI CULTURE
DI STRICT TO THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN, RD-2 TOMHOVE
RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN, RA-2 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL MODERATE DENSI TY, AND C
2 COWMERCI AL NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR DI STRI CTS, PETI TI ON NO. 2292- 2015,
AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. The
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber M chel |l e Erpenbach to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday,
April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for Item 44.

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Greg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex
Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
for Item 45:

45, 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF E. 41ST ST. AND S. SYCAMORE AVE. FROM THE C-
2 COWMERCI AL NEI GHBORHOCOD AND STREETCAR DI STRICT TO THE G
3 COWMMERCI AL COVMUNI TY DI STRICT, | NCLUDI NG CONDI TI ONS AS ALLOWED | N SECTI ON
160. 650 (e) PLACING LI M TATI ONS ON REGULATI ONS W THI N THE RE4 FORM
PETI TI ON NO. 2298-2015, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG VAP OF THE CI TY OF
SI QUX FALLS. The Pl anni ng Conmi ssion reconmends approval subject to: 1)
Bui I ding of no nore than 30,000 square feet of gross floor area.

A notion was made by Council Menber Rex Rol fing and seconded by Council Menber
Kenny Anderson Jr. to set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April



7, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for |tem 45,

Vote to set a date: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M
Eri ckson, M chelle Erpenbach, Geg Janmi son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex
Rol fing, 7. Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

46. A RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE PUBLI C RI GHT- OF- WAY ON N. NATI ONAL AVE. FROM THE
SOQUTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF E. BENSON RD. TO THE NORTH RI GHT- OF- WAY LI NE OF
E. 39TH ST. N. AND ON E. HOGAN AVE. FROM THE EAST RI GHT- OF- WAY LI NE OF N
NATI ONAL AVE. TO THE WEST RI GHT- OF-WAY LI NE OF N. CASCO AVE.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Rick Kiley to adopt said Resolution No. 11-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 11-15

A RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE PUBLI C RI GHT- OF- WAY ON N. NATI ONAL AVE. FROM THE
SQUTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF E. BENSON RD. TO THE NORTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LI NE OF E.
39TH ST. N. AND ON E. HOGAN AVE. FROM THE EAST RI GHT- OF-WAY LI NE OF N. NATI ONAL
AVE. TO THE WEST RI GHT- OF-WAY LI NE OF N. CASCO AVE.

WHEREAS, a petition of the owners of:

Tract 9 of Taylor s Subdivision (unit No. 6) of part of the West Half of the
Nort hwest Quarter (WL/2NWL/4) of Section 3, Township 101 North, Range 49 West,
M nnehaha County, SD (1401 E. Benson Rd.)

Lot 3 of Tract 1 of Traub Subdivision of part of the West Half of the Northwest
Quarter (WL/2NWL/4) of Section 3, Township 101 North, Range 49 Wst, M nnehaha
County, SD (1500 E. 39th St. N.)

Vacated Bath Ave. and the North One-Half (N1/2) of vacated Lowell Ave. both

I ying adjacent to Blocks 3 and 4 of the National Realty Conpanys Addition to
Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD, except Lot H1 (1701 E. Benson Rd.)

Vacated Bath Ave. and the South One-Half (S1/2) of vacated Lowell Ave. both
lying adjacent to Blocks 5 and 6 of the National Realty Conpanys Addition to
Si oux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD (3700 N. National Ave.)

Tract 8, WIllers Addition to the Cty of Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD
(3600 N. National Ave.)

Adj acent one-half vacated streets and Block 13 of the National Realty Conpanys
Addition to the Gty of Sioux Falls, Mnnehaha County, SD (3600 N. National
Ave.)

VWHEREAS, the hearing was held on March 10, 2015, and the petition has been duly
exam ned and investigated by the City Council of the City of Sioux Falls.
Testinmony in support of said petition has been heard, and no opposition hereto
was Vvoi ced. Said property, as shown upon the plats attached to and nmade a part
of said petition, has not been used as a street or ally in the past twenty
years and no | onger serves a useful purpose.

NOW THEREFORE, BE I T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.



That the public right-of-way on N. National Ave. fromthe south right-of-way
line of E. Benson Rd. to the north right-of-way line of E. 39th St. N and on
E. Hogan Ave. fromthe east right-of-way line of N. National Ave. to the west
right-of-way line of N Casco Ave. to the Cty of Sioux Falls, M nnehaha
County, SD, be and the sane hereby is declared vacated, and subject to an
easenent reserved by the City of Sioux Falls in, over, and upon such vacated
property for drai nage, sewer, water and gas nains and electric, tel ephone
lines, cable TV, and all public utility uses required or authorized by the City
of Sioux Falls as shown on Exhibit A and that the City derk shall cause to be
filed with the Register of Deeds, M nnehaha County, SD, a duly certified
transcript of this resolution.

Dat e adopted: 3/17/15 .

M ke T. Huet her Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad

Cty derk

47. A RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE PUBLI C RI GHT- OF-WAY ON S. EUCLI D AVE. FROM THE
SOUTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF W 22ND ST. TO THE NORTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF W
25TH ST.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menber Dean Karsky to adopt said Resolution No. 12-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Greg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 12-15

A RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE PUBLI C RI GHT- OF- WAY ON S. EUCLI D AVE. FROM THE SOUTH
Rl GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF W 22ND ST. TO THE NORTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF W 25TH ST.
WHEREAS, a petition of the owners of:

Al'l of Lots 16 in Block 2 of Buxton Subdivision of Block B of Hayward Addition
to Sioux Falls, Mnnehaha County, SD, along with the east half (E1/2) of the
vacated alley lying adjacent thereto as well as the north half (N1/2) of the
vacated 23rd St. lying adjacent thereto;

Al'l of Lots 16 in Block 3 of Buxton Subdivision of Block B of Hayward Addition
to Sioux Falls, Mnnehaha County, SD, along with the east half (E1/2) of the
vacated alley lying adjacent thereto as well as the south half (S1/2) of the
vacated 23rd St. lying adjacent thereto along with the north half (N1/2) of the
vacated 24th St. |lying adjacent thereto;

All of Lots 16 in Block 2 of Moer & Sherman Subdivision of Block E of
Hayward Addition to Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD, and the south half (S1/
2) of vacated 24th St. |lying adjacent thereto;

Al of Lots 6, 7, 8, and 10 of Resubdivision of Block 1 of Buxton Subdivision
of Block B of Hayward Addition to the Cty of Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County,
SD, and the north half (N1/2) of the vacated 23rd St. |ying adjacent thereto;
Al of Lots 712 in Block 4 of Buxton Subdivision of Block B of Hayward
Addition to the Gty of Sioux Falls, Mnnehaha County, SD, and the vacated

all ey lying adjacent thereto; and the south half (S1/2) of vacated 23rd St.



| ying adjacent thereto and the north half (N1/2) of vacated 24th St. |lying

adj acent thereto;

Al of Lots 712 in Block 1 of Moer & Sherman Subdivision of Block E of
Hayward Addition to Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD, and the south half (S1/
2) of vacated 24th St. |lying adjacent thereto;

VWHEREAS, the hearing was held on Tuesday, March 10, 2015, and the petition has
been duly exam ned and investigated by the City Council of the Cty of Sioux
Falls. Testinmony in support of said petition has been heard, and no opposition
hereto was voiced. Said property, as shown upon the plats attached to and nade
a part of said petition, has been used as a street or ally and no | onger serves
a useful purpose.

NOW THEREFORE, BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD

That the public right-of-way on S. Euclid Ave. fromthe south right-of-way line
of W 22nd St. to the north right-of-way line of W 25th St. to the Gty of
Sioux Falls, M nnehaha County, SD, be and the sane hereby is declared vacated,
and subject to an easenent reserved by the City of Sioux Falls in, over, and
upon such vacated property for gas mains as shown on Exhibit A and that the
City Cerk shall cause to be filed with the Register of Deeds, M nnehaha
County, SD, a duly certified transcript of this resolution

Dat e adopted: 3/17/15

M ke T. Huet her Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad

Cty derk

48. A RESCLUTION COF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE PLACEMENT OF
SCULPTURES ON PUBLI C PROPERTY FOR AN | NTERNATI ONALLY RECOGNI ZED VI SUAL ARTS
PROGRAM KNOWN AS SCULPTUREWALK SI OUX FALLS 2015.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Counci
Menber Dean Karsky to adopt said Resolution No. 13-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.
Mbti on Passed.
RESCLUTI ON NO. 13-15

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE PLACEMENT OF
SCULPTURES ON PUBLI C PROPERTY FOR AN | NTERNATI ONALLY RECOGNI ZED VI SUAL ARTS
PROGRAM KNOWN AS SCULPTUREWALK SI OUX FALLS 2015.

VWHEREAS, the 2015 Scul ptureWal k programw |l bring a | arge nunber of scul ptures
to the central business district for outdoor display; and

WHEREAS, the Scul ptureWal k program enhances the beauty and culture of the
downtown area for all citizens and visitors to enjoy; and

VWHEREAS, 55 of the proposed scul ptures will be placed on public right-of-way or
other publicly owned property; and

VWHEREAS, the exhibition of public art in the central business district is
recommended and encouraged by the City of Sioux Falls 2025 Downtown Pl an and
the 2015 Cultural Plan; and

VWHEREAS, the Scul ptureWal k programrepresents a broad col | aboration of

i ndividuals and entities, both public and private, including Downtown Sioux
Falls, the Sioux Falls Arts Council, the Chanber of Comerce, and the Gty of
Sioux Falls; and

WHEREAS, the Sioux Falls Visual Arts Conmmi ssion and various City departnent
staff have reviewed the proposed 2015 scul ptures and their placenents and



recomend approval to the Cty Council;
NOW THEREFORE, BE I T RESOLVED BY THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.
That it approves the placenent in public right-of-way and on public property of
55 scul ptures, as described by the foll ow ng:
Scul ptures and Artists

Al'l Under Heaven G Mendez

I nner G fts JC Del | enbaugh

Ice FlowJ. Nel son

CourtshipJ. MKellar

Cimarron Il W Sal ge

Learning to Swi mJ. W ndel |
Abr aham Li ncol nJ. Mher

In the MxS. Quinlan

Bugs C. Powel |

TriceratopP. Frazee

Spirit Bear D. Pettigrew
VWaiting in DepthJ. Frazee
River OtersE. Thorsen

Ral ph Moose M Pettigrew
Sunday with JessieS. Geissler
Here Conmes the SunE. Altman
Cotta Practice First L. Leuning and S. Treeby
Fl ouri sh A, Guntren

Punkswi ngM Br own

Redst one Grasses D. Lanphere
Ancestral Menory P. Vogel aar
Steel StallionS. Schlag
Macondo S. Maeck

The Actor D. C enents

In Love Wth the WndS. Mznevsky
Thi nk Tank D. Skora

The Archer C. Kil bane

Wonderer W Choi

Persi stent Parachutes N. Johansen
Stag Beetle M Km ot ek

Criss Cross D. Skora

Fawned Menories C. Knapp

Qur Heritage is Qur FutureB. Victor
CrocodileD. Lew s

Lady Curl H Linke

WaitingS. Ghosh

Ri si ng Rai nbowD. Turner
BrennaD. J. Mayne

Bear Cubs B. Carlyle

Spaul di ng H.  Hoy

@Gl | opi ng Ghost L. Starck

No Room for Doubt R Brubaker
Book PedlersJ. Morford

Your Canopy T. Bayl or

Bi g Easy O. Obazee

The Generosity of CreativityT. Lind
The Truth of Geonetry T. Lind
Portal T. Riefe

Fi nal FandangoS. Morin

Roust Here S. Jurgensm er
Enbrace L. Carleton

RuinN. Wffill

Final Warrior T. Ford

Mystic Warriors G Monaco



Raven J. Spendl ove

Locati ons

Pavilion areallth Street and Main Avenue.
Pavi l i on South Pl aza.

Home Federal .

Interstate O fice Products.

Boyce Greenfield.

11th Street and Phillips Avenue.

Nort hwest corner of 11th Street and Phillips Avenue.
Car pent er Condos sout h.

Car penter Condos north.

Ms. Mirphys Irish Gfts.

Prairie Star Gallery.

Sout hwest corner of Tenth Street and Phillips Avenue.
Tenth Street and Phillips Avenue.
Nort hwest corner of Tenth Street and Phillips Avenue.

Sout h of Diner.

Sout h of Diner.

Phillips Avenue Diner.

Sout heast side of Fountain.

Sout h side of Fountain.

North side of Fountain.

In front of Frontier Bank.

In front of DocuTap.

Wl | s Fargo.

Nort hwest corner of Ninth Street and Main Avenue.
US Bank.

Nort hwest corner of Eighth Street and Phillips Avenue.
Ei ghth Street and Uptown to East Eighth Street.
O pheum Theat er.

Nort heast corner of Sixth Street and Main Avenue.

Adwer ks.
Nort heast corner of Fifth Street and Mai n Avenue.
Nort heast corner of Seventh Street and Phillips Avenue.

Along bike trail north of Eighth Street.

East Eighth Street north side of Reid Street.

Sout heast corner of Eighth Street and Reid Street Eighth Street and RR Center.
Ninth Street and Phillips Avenue.

Fi rst National Bank.

Fi rst Financial Center.

Fi rst Financial Planter.

Between Ninth Street and Tenth Street east side on Phillips Avenue.
Between Ninth Street and Tenth Street east side on Phillips Avenue.
Skel | ys.

Tenth Street and Phillips Avenue.

Sout heast corner of Tenth Street and Phillips Avenue.

Rehf el ds.

Near Crawfords.

Chef Doni ni que s.

Nort heast corner of 11th Street and Phillips Avenue.
11th Street and Phillips Avenue.

Sout heast corner of 11th Street and Phillips Avenue.
Dacot ah Bank.

Haskett s Restaurant.

Nort heast corner of 12th Street and Phillips Avenue.
Nort heast corner of 12th Street and Phillips Avenue.
Sout heast corner of 12th Street and Phillips Avenue.
Nort heast corner of 13th Street and Phillips Avenue.
13th Street and Phillips Avenue.



Nort hwest corner of 13th Street and Phillips Avenue.
Nort hwest corner of 12th Street and Phillips Avenue in planter
Bechtol d Jewel ry.

Mei erhenry Sargent Law Firm

CH Pati sseri e.

M nervas.

Al ternates (11)

Storytellers G Mnaco

Gener ati ons B. Hanmond

Prairie ShipG Mieller

Raven G Monaco

On Top of the WrldR Poey

Green PieceN Pierce

Childs Play RevisitedS. Mrin

Homage to OtoS. W Maeck

SaturnianS. W Meck

I nfluences H Otega

Jack H. Hoy

Dat e adopted: 3/17/15 .

M ke T. Huet her Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad

Cty derk

49. A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE COVPREHENSI VE PARKS AND RECREATI ON SYSTEM MASTER
PLAN.

A notion was made by Council Menber Kenny Anderson Jr. and seconded by Council
Menmber M chel |l e Erpenbach to adopt said Resol ution No. 14-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, G eg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 14-15

A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE COVPREHENSI VE PARKS AND RECREATI ON SYSTEM MASTER
PLAN.

VWHEREAS, Sioux Falls Parks and Recreation has devel oped a conprehensi ve parks
and recreation systemmaster plan; and

WHEREAS, the plan has nerit and would be a benefit to the city in its system of
parks and recreation facilities; and

WHEREAS, the Sioux Falls Parks and Recreation Board reconmended adoption of the
conpr ehensi ve parks and recreati on system naster plan on March 17, 2015;

NOW THEREFORE, BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD

The Conprehensive Parks and Recreation System Master Plan dated March 2015,
which is attached hereto and nade a part of this resolution, is hereby

appr oved.

The City shall publish this resolution, without attachnent, after its passage.
The attachnent is on file and available for inspection in the office of the
Cty derk.



Dat e adopted: 3/17/15 .

M ke T. Huet her Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad

Cty derk

50. A RESOLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menber Rick Kiley to adopt said Resolution No. 15-15.

Vote to adopt: Roll Call: Yeses, Kenny Anderson Jr., Christine M Erickson,
M chel | e Erpenbach, Greg Jam son, Dean Karsky, Rick Kiley, Rex Rolfing, 7.
Noes, O.

Mbti on Passed.

RESOLUTI ON NO. 15-15

A RESOLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

BE | T RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD.

That it gives its advice and consent to the followi ng Mayoral appoi ntnents:

Nane Boar d Term

Wanda Harris Board of Ethics Appointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough February
2017 (to fill the unexpired
termof Ronald Sisk).

John Jack Marsh Board of Ethics Appointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2019
(to replace Robert Swanhorst).

Susan Aguil ar Charter Revision Conmm ssion Appointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2019
(to replace Denni s Aanenson).

Jill Entennan Charter Revision Conmm ssion Appointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2019
(to replace De Knudson).

Paul i ne Pol et es Charter Revision Comm ssion Reappointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2020.
Justin Smith Charter Revision Comm ssion Appointed for a termfrom

March 2015 t hrough March 2019
(to replace Richard

Gregerson).
Robert Thi njon Charter Revision Comm ssion Reappointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2020.
Tana Zwart Di sability Awareness Appointed for a termfrom
Conmi ssi on March 2015 t hrough June 2016
(to fill the unexpired term of
Mchelle Gim.
Janes Beddow Housi ng and Redevel opnent Appointed for a termfrom
Conmi ssi on March 2015 t hrough March 2020

(to replace Harriet Scott).
Roger Ni kol as Mechani cal Board of Appeal s Appointed for a termfrom



and Exam ners March 2015 t hrough March 2018

(to replace Gregory Bertsch).

Megan Myers Public Transit Advisory Board Reappointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2018.

Brett dirbas Public Transit Advisory Board Appointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough June 2016
(to fill the unexpired term of
M nnie Bell).

Jeri Reed Public Transit Advisory Board Appointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2018
(to replace Debra Nel son).

Ross Mck MIller Solid Waste Pl anni ng Board I ndefinite termTurner County
representative (to replace
John Overby).

St eve Brunmond Vi sual Arts Conmi ssion Reappointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2018.

Larry Ling Vi sual Arts Conmi ssion Reappointed for a termfrom
March 2015 t hrough March 2018.

Sandra Pay Vi sual Arts Conmi ssion Appointed for a termfrom

March 2015 t hrough February
2016 (to fill the unexpired
term of Nan Baker).

Dat e adopted: 3/17/15 .

M ke T. Huet her Mayor
ATTEST:

Lori e Hogstad

Cty derk

NEW BUSI NESS
Mayor Huet her recogni zed Scout Troop 371 in the audi ence.

ADJ OQURNMENT

A notion was made by Council Menber M chell e Erpenbach and seconded by Council
Menmber Kenny Anderson Jr. to adjourn the neeting at 8:05 p.m

Mayor Huether took a voice vote and all nenbers voted yes.

Mbti on Passed.

Tamara Jorgensen, MVC
Assistant City Oerk

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOAN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. HOWEVER, THE SOUTH DAKOTA SUPREME COURT HAS RULED THAT Cl TY

COUNCI LORS MAY NOT ENGAGE | N PRI VATE COVMUNI CATI ONS W TH PERSONS WHEN THE CI TY
COUNCI L WLL ACT AS A DECI SI O\ MAKER ON AN UPCOM NG MATTER | NVOLVI NG A LI CENSE
OR A PERM T. I N THOSE | NSTANCES, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE WRI TTEN
COWENTS TO THE ENTIRE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COMVENT AT THE PUBLIC
MEETI NG ON THAT MATTER WHEN | T |'S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE



VWHO PROVI DE COMMENTS SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMVENTS W LL BECOVE PART OF
THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EW BY ALL PARTI ES AND THE PUBLI C.
ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L:  PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON CI TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4:00 P.M COUNCI L COW TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE
THE FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MMVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

I NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NG CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS AR LIVE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7: 00 P.M  THE JO NT ClI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI'VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5: 00
P.M REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE CITY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCHI VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR
VI EW NG ON DEMAND AT WAW SI OQUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
PCSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING G TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON CI TYLI NK.

CI TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGSAT 1:30 AM AND 9:00 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6: 00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COW TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8: 00 A M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5:00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS
AT 2:30 AM AND 10: 00 A.M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7:00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JAONT A TY
COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8: 00 A-M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER
LI VE MEETI NG AND 1: 00 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



