

City Council Meetings
2/9/2016 7:00:00 PM

SIRE Meeting Contents

INVOCATION

Reverend David Kraemer, All Souls Unitarian Universalist Church

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

PROCLAMATIONS

Congenital Heart Defect Awareness Week (February 7-14, 2016)

RECOGNITION/AWARDS

VISITOR RECOGNITION

CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

MINUTES

Informational Meeting of Monday, February 1, 2016, at 4 p.m.

Regular City Council Meeting of Monday, February 1, 2016, at 7 p.m.

COMMUNICATIONS

Approval of Contracts/ Agreements on the February 4, 2016, memo.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: January 27, 2016 #1 & #2 Dyed Diesel 15,000 Gallons (7,500 Gallons each) Harms Oil (\$1.1155 #1 DM & \$0.9866 #2 DM) Howes Oil (\$1.1075 #1 DM & \$1.0190 #2 DM) Cole's Petroleum (\$1.1189 #1 DM & \$1.0315 #2 DM

Report of Requests for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016 Unleaded Ethanol 675 Gallons Stern Oil (\$1.3094) Howes Oil and Midway Service, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Stern Oil.

Report of Requests for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016 Clear Diesel #1 581 Gallons Stern Oil (\$1.5244) Howes Oil and Midway Service, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Stern Oil.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016 E-10 Unleaded Ethanol/87 Octane 8,500 Gallons Howes Oil (\$1.1135) Cole's Petroleum (\$1.1175) Harms Oil (\$1.1351) Stern Oil (\$1.1454) CHS, Inc. (\$1.2200) Olson Oil and Midway (Vollan Oil),

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016 70/30 #2/#1 Clear Diesel Blend CHS, Inc. (\$1.4874) Howes Oil (\$1.4125) Harms Oil (\$1.3867) Midwest Oil and Petroleum Traders Co., both no bid. Bid awarded to: Harms Oil.

A communication was received from Debra Rohrer requesting permission to consume, but not sell, wine and malt beverages at the Brennan Rock & Roll Academy, 900 W. 11th St., on Saturday, March 26, 2016, for a fundraiser.

Report for Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016 Clear Diesel #2, 581 Gallons Stern Oil (41.4634) Midway Service and Howes Oil, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Stern Oil.

COUNCIL'S INTERNAL DEPARTMENTAL DIRECTIVES

APPLICATIONS

LaVone M. Wagner, 1201 N. Dakota Avenue, for 2015 taxes in the amount of \$701.21.

Roger D. Thielsen, 1012 N. Sherman Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$307.05.

Nancy A. Hansen, 1009 W. 7th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$125.47.

Lyle W. Burrell, Jr., 5508 W. 45th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$819.88.

Janet K. Best, 528 N. Sherman Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$49.30.

Sheila M. Felker, 1108 W. 57th Street, #304, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$257.48.

Marion Johnson, 5115 E. 22nd Street, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$495.85.

Vincent F. Kellar, 2509 W. Rice Street, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$765.30.

Gloria K. Spriggs, 1512 S. Riverdale Road, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$590.10.

Victoria Raidme, 916 N. Leadale Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$741.36.

Dennis D. Erickson, 804 S. Hawthorne Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$307.70.

Arlene Wagner, 7010 W. 56th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$509.68.

Ronnie J. Pekron, 411 S. Holly Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the amount of \$694.44.

NOTICE OF HEARINGS

REGULAR AGENDA ITEMS

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

PUBLIC INPUT

PETITIONS

UNFINISHED BUSINESS

INTRODUCTION AND ADOPTION OF ORDINANCES

1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, APPROVING A GRANT OF ELECTRIC TRANSMISSION EASEMENT.

1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, AMENDING THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDING SECTION 124.012 RAISING SIOUX AREA METRO PARATRANSIT FARES.

HEARINGS AND RESOLUTIONS

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE RELEASE OF THE PERMANENT DRAINAGEWAY EASEMENT LOCATED IN BLOCK 9, NORTH RIDGE ADDITION TO THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, MINNEHAHA COUNTY, SOUTH DAKOTA.

A RESOLUTION ADVISING AND GIVING CONSENT TO THE APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS TO CERTAIN CITIZEN BOARDS.

NOTICE OF HEARINGS FOR STREET VACATIONS

REPORT OF OFFICERS/BOARDS/COMMITTEES/TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRIATION BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS WITHIN A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANIZATIONAL UNIT AS PROVIDED IN THE SIOUX FALLS CITY CHARTER SECTION 5.07(d)

NEW BUSINESS

ITEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLINE

ADJOURNMENT

EXECUTIVE SESSION