| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| Agenda |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
|| MEETI NG OF Tuesday, March 15, 2016 at 7 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT

Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr.
Counci | Menber Christine M Erickson
Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach
Counci| Menber Greg Janison

Counci| Menber Dean Karsky

Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers
Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

&#9679; Dr. Ron Tottingham Enpire Baptist Tenple

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

PROCLAMATI ONS

&#9679; Social Wrk Mnth -- March 2016

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

M NUTES

&#9679; Infornmational Meeting of Tuesday, March 8, 2016, at 4 p.m
&#9679; City Council Meeting of Tuesday, March 8, 2016, at 7 p.m

COVMMUNI CATI ONS



1. Approval of contracts/agreenents on the March 10, 2016, neno.

2. A nenorandum dated February 29, 2016, declaring surplus property.

3. Appoint 67 Precinct Superintendents and 148 Precinct Deputies for the April
12, 2016, City of Sioux Falls Municipal/School Board El ection.

4. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 1, 2016; Unl eaded
Et hanol ; 618 gallons; Howes O ($1.7625); Mdway Service, Stern G|, and
Coles Petroleum all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes G |.

5. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 1, 2016; C ear Di esel
#1; 532 gallons; Howes O ($1.6150); Mdway Service, Stern G1l, and Coles
Petroleum all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Q.

6. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 1, 2016; C ear Di esel
#2; 532 gallons; Howes O ($1.5510); Mdway Service, Stern G1l, and Coles
Petroleum all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes Q.

7. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 2, 2016; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 7,500 gallons (2,000 gallons #1 & 5,500 gallons #2); Stern Q|
($1.2250 #1 DM & $1.1644 #2 DM); Harns O | ($1.2425 #1 DM & $1.1925 #2 DM ;
Coles Petroleum ($1.2782 #1 DM & $1.2002 #2 DM; Howes G| ($1.2615 #1 DM &
$1.2080 #2 DM); CHS, Inc., Mdwest Ol, Mdway Service (Vollan), and O son
Ol, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Stern G l.

8. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 3, 2016; Unl eaded
Et hanol & E-85; 8,500 gallons (7,500 gallons Unl eaded & 1,000 gallons E-85);
Col es Petrol eum ($1. 4660 Unl eaded & $1.2480 E-85); Howes O ($1.4770
Unl eaded & $1.2599 E-85); Stern O (%$1.4909 Unl eaded & $1.3623 E-85); CHS,
Inc. ($1.5500 Unl eaded & $1.2900 E-85); A son Ql, Harms O, and Vollan
Ol, all no bid; Bid awarded to: Coles Petrol eum

APPLI CATI ONS

The foll owi ng abatenents were recommended for approval by the Director of
Equal i zation and the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for Mnnehaha County; and the
City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

9. Sout heastern Devel opnent Foundation, 500 N. Western Avenue, Suite 100, for
2015 property taxes in the anmount of $200.49. The house was razed on
Sept enber 30, 2015.

10. Messi ah New Hope Church, 5001 E. Madison Street, for 2015 property taxes in
t he anount of $3,164.48. The daycare operation noved out on May 31, 2015.

Itens 11- 19: The anmpunt requested is the difference between the elderly freeze
and the non-elderly freeze.



11. Elizabeth D. Janes, 1208 N. Connor Trail, for 2015 property taxes in the
anount of $288. 16.

12. Doris M Vanderham 2605 S. Anderson Drive, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $902. 45.

13. Theresa C. Bigge, 1801 S. Euclid Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $476. 59.

14. Inga Hess, 1307 W 14th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the anount of
$1, 043. 35.

15. Lenice J. Jensen, 115 N Lake Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the anmount
of $347.91.

16. Suzanne Knudson, 1709 E. Ponderosa Drive, for 2015 property taxes in the
anount of $41.47.

17. Sharon L. Schrag, 306 N. Cdiff Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $15. 40.

18. Ava |. Ginmshaw, 3608 S. Gateway Boul evard, Apt. 302, for 2015 property
taxes in the anount of $68.10.

19. Sam J. Nastase, 601 S. Bahnson Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $900. 06.

The foll owi ng abatenents were recomended for denial by the Director of
Equal i zation and the States Attorney Ofice for Lincoln County; and the City
Attorney for Sioux Falls:

20. Richard & Arianne Zieske, 7508 S. Chatworth Circle, for 2015 property taxes
in the anpbunt of $3,721.98.

21. David & Debbie Landreth, 5445 S. Salvation Place, for 2015 property taxes
in the anpbunt of $2, 954.74.

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, April 5, 2015, at 7 p.m for Itens 22
t hrough 33:

22. A PROPOSED RESOLUTI ON DECLARI NG THE NECESSI TY TO GRADE, GRAVEL, CONSTRUCT
CURB AND GUTTER W TH DRI VEWAY APPROACHES, CONSTRUCT SI DEWALK, STORM SEWER
ASPHALT SURFACI NG, WATER, SANI TARY SEVER, AND STREETLI GHTS ON S. BRANDE
AVE., AND ASSESSI NG THE COST TO EACH LOT OR TRACT OF LAND BENEFI TI NG
THEREBY.



23.

24,

25.

26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

New 2016 Package Liquor License for Aldi Inc., Adi Foods #20, 2804 South
Loui se Avenue (CUP not required).

New 2016 Package Li quor License for Aldi Inc., Adi Foods #21, 5105 East
Arrowhead Parkway (CUP not required).

New 2016 Retail Wne License for BYG SF, LLC, Backyard Gill, 323 South
Phillips Avenue (CUP not required).

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for The
History ub to be operated at Josiahs Cof feehouse & Caf@ 101 South Reid
Street, for a fundraiser on April 7, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for The
Country Cub of Sioux Falls to be operated at Hone Federal Bank, 225 South
Mai n Avenue, for a Chanber M xer on April 12, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Sisters of the Presentation of
the Blessed Virgin Mary to be operated at Falls Park, 305 East Falls Park
Drive, for the Cinco de Mayo Fiesta, on May 7, 2016.

Special One-Day Wne License for the Sioux Falls Area Conmunity Foundation
to be operated at Sioux Falls Area Conmmunity Foundation, 200 North Cherapa
Pl ace, for a Science Fest social on June 10, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Osher
Lifelong Learning Institute to be operated in the CNA Buil ding

Conmmruni cati on Room 101 South Reid and the 8th & Railroad Shopping Center
back dock and patio, 401 East 8th Street, for a Science Happy Hour on June
10, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for The
Center for Equality to be operated at Terrace Park, 1100 West 4th Street,
for a Sioux Falls Pride event on June 18, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Conmmenorative Air Force Joe Foss Squadron to be operated at Maverick Air
Center, 4201 North Maverick Place, for a Hangar Dance on July 21, 2016.

Special One-Day Wne License for Senior Ctizens Services Inc., to be
operated at Active Cenerations, 2300 West 46th Street, for the Gournet Quys
fundraiser, on April 17, 2016.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA



PUBLI C | NPUT

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS

34.

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

43.

44,

Transfer of 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License, with video lottery
termnals, from Suburban Lanes Inc., Players Pub, 2621 South Spring Avenue,
to GL Managenent LLC, Great Life at Suburban Lanes, 2621 South Spring
Avenue.

New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for BYG SF, LLC, Backyard Gill,
323 South Phillips Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per
Fire and Buil di ng Servi ces.

New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for Kahli s Kuts LLC, Bryant Sal on
& Spa, 3101 West 41st Street (CUP not required).

New 2016 Retail Wne License for Kahli s Kuts LLC, Bryant Salon & Spa, 3101
West 41st Street (CUP not required).

New 2016 Package Liquor License for Walmart Stores Inc., Walnmart, 7821
South M nnesota Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per
Fire and Buil di ng Servi ces.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
August ana University to be operated at the Elnen Center, 2001 South Sunmit
Avenue, for a fundraiser on April 1, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Package OFf-Sale Wne |icense for Avera Mkennan Foundation
to be operated at Avera Prairie Center, 1000 East 23rd Street, for a
fundraiser on April 8, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Catering America Inc., to be operated at Sioux Falls State Theatre, 316
South Phillips Avenue, for a retirenent social on April 9, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Liquor License for Ovations Food Services, LP to be
operated at Sanford Research Center, 2301 East 60th Street North, for a
di nner on April 13, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Liquor License for Sertoma Butterfly House & Marine Cove,
4320 South Oxbow Avenue, for a fundraiser on April 15, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Stockyards Plaza Inc., to be operated at the Falls Park Horsebarn for
social on March 31, 2016.



I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

45. 2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
NORTH OF 1-90 AND EAST OF N. MARION RD. FROM THE AG AGRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO
THE CN CONSERVATI ON, C-2 COMMERCI AL NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR, AND | -
2 HEAVY | NDUSTRI AL DI STRI CTS, PETITION NO. 4173-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE
OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssion
recomends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
I tem 46:

46. 1st Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOQUX FALLS, SD, ENCOURAG NG
PARKI NG STRI P LANDSCAPI NG AND PROVI DI NG STANDARDS THEREFCR

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 47:

47. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE 2013
SHAPE PLACES ZONI NG ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng
Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 48:

48. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT NORTHEAST CORNER OF S. SHERMAN AVE. AND E. 22ND ST. FROM THE RS SI NGLE-
FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT TO THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL TRADI TI ONAL DI STRI CT, PETI TION NO. 4039-2016, AND AVENDI NG THE
OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssion
recomends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 49:

49. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 605 N. LA MESA DR FROM THE AG AGRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO THE RS S| NGLE-
FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN DI STRI CT, PETI TION NO. 4144-2016, AND AMENDI NG
THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on
recomends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 50:

50. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 120 N. SYCAMORE AVE. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN
DI STRICT TO THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL LOW DENSI TY DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON
NO. 4159-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY COF SI QUX
FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmm ssi on recomends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 51:

51. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT NORTHWEST CORNER OF N. TERRY AVE. AND W MADI SON ST. FROM THE | -1 LIGHT
| NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT TO THE C- 2 COWMERCI AL NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR
DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 4179-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF
THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conm ssi on recommends approval .



Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 52:

52. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT SOUTHWEST CORNER OF E. 26TH ST. AND S. SIX MLE RD. FROM THE RS SI NGLE-
FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN AND CN CONSERVATI ON DI STRI CTS TO THE RS SI NGLE-
FAM LY RESI DENTI AL SUBURBAN AND CN CONSERVATI ON DI STRI CTS, PETI TI ON NO.
4183-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE OFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF THE CI TY OF Sl QUX FALLS.
Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 53:

53. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIOUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY
AT 5100 W 12TH ST. FROM THE |-1 LI GHT | NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT TO THE C
3 COWMERCI AL COWUNI TY DI STRICT, PETITION NO. 4184-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE
OFFI CI AL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssion
recomends approval .

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 54:

54. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 51: UTILITY RATES AND
CHARGES; SUBCHAPTER WATER DI STRI BUTI ON PLATTI NG FEE, SECTI ON 51. 065 WATER
DI STRI BUTI ON PLATTI NG FEE.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
I tem 55:

55. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 96: STREETS AND S| DEWALKS,;
SUBCHAPTER ARTERI AL STREET PLATTI NG FEE; SECTI ON 96. 220 ARTERI AL STREET
PLATTI NG FEE.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
I tem 56:

56. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE
NAM NG OF A FACI LI TY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. (Jerstad Gallery).

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 57:

57. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CITY OF SIQUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE
NAM NG OF A FACI LI TY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. (Shultz Gallery).

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 58:

58. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AVENDI NG SECTI ON 124. 012 TO PROVI DE YOUTH AN
COPPORTUNI TY TO RI DE FI XED- ROUTE BUS SERVI CE AT NO CHARGE FROM JUNE 2, 2016,
TO SEPTEMBER 6, 2016.

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, April 5, 2016, at 7 p.m for
Item 59:

59. 1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG



SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS. ($1, 299, 000 Hi ghways and Streets).

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

60. A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF Sl QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
FOUNDATI ON PARK ADDI TI ON. Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on reconmends approval

61. A RESOLUTI ON ABATI NG FRONT FOOT ASSESSMENTS FOR STREET MAI NTENANCE FEES AT
PARCEL | DS 35194, 35196, 35197, 35198, 35200, AND 35201.

62. A RESOLUTI ON ABATI NG STORM DRAI NAGE AND STREET MAI NTENANCE FEES ON CERTAI N
PARCELS W THI N NE1/4 OF SECTI ON 8- TI0ON- RAOW OF THE 5TH P.M TO THE CI TY OF
SI QUX FALLS, LINCOLN COUNTY, SD.

63. A RESOLUTI ON ABATI NG STORM DRAI NAGE FEES ON CERTAI N PARCELS W TH N WESTWOOD
VALLEY ADDI TION TO THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, M NNEHAHA COUNTY, SD.

64. A RESOLUTI ON ABATI NG STORM DRAI NAGE FEES ON CERTAI N PARCELS W THI N TI MBER
QAK ADDI TION TO THE A TY OF Sl QUX FALLS, LINCOLN COUNTY, SD.

65. A RESOLUTI ON ABATI NG STORM DRAI NAGE AND STREET MAI NTENANCE FEES ON CERTAI N
PARCELS W THI N WESTWOOD VALLEY ADDI TION TO THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS,
M NNEHAHA COUNTY, SD.

66. A RESOLUTI ON AMENDI NG THE CI TY OF SI OQUX FALLS ENG NEERI NG DESI GN STANDARDS.

67. A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE PLACEMENT OF
SCULPTURES ON PUBLI C PROPERTY FOR AN | NTERNATI ONALLY RECOGNI ZED VI SUAL ARTS
PROGRAM KNOWN AS SCULPTUREWALK SI QUX FALLS 2016.

68. A RESOLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

NEW BUSI NESS

| TEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLI| NE

The City Council may include other such business as may cone before this body.

ADJ OURNMENT

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOMN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND



FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCI L WLL ACT AS A DECI SI ON- MVAKER ON AN UPCOM NG
MATTER | NVOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE

VRI TTEN COMVENTS TO THE ENTIRE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COMMENT AT THE
PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM | S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE
VWHO PROVI DE COMMENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMMENTS NAY
BECOVE PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EW BY ALL PARTIES AND THE
PUBLI C.

ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L:  PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON CI TYLI NK: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COWMM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE
FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

I NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NG CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS AR LIVE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M  THE JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY
COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5 P. M

REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCHI VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR

VI EW NG ON DEMAND ATWAN SI OQUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
PCSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING G TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON CI TYLI NK.

CI TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORVATI ONAL MEETINGS AT 1:30 A M AND 9 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6 P. M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COWM TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8 A M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5 P.M ON SATURDAYS. CITY COUNCI L MEETI NGS AT 2: 30
AM AND 10 A°M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/

M NNEHAHA COUNTY COMM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8 A M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER LI VE

MEETI NG AND 1 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



