| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| Agenda |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
| MEETI NG OF Tuesday, February 9, 2016 at 7: 00 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT

Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr.
Counci | Menber Christine M Erickson
Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach
Counci| Menber Greg Janison

Counci| Menber Dean Karsky

Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers
Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

&#9679; Reverend David Kraemer, All Souls Unitarian Universalist Church
PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

PROCLAMATI ONS

&#9679; Congenital Heart Defect Awareness Wek (February 7-14, 2016)
CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

M NUTES

&#9679; Infornmational Meeting of Monday, February 1, 2016, at 4 p.m
&#9679; Regular City Council Meeting of Mnday, February 1, 2016, at 7 p.m

COVMMUNI CATI ONS



1. Approval of Contracts/ Agreenents on the February 4, 2016, neno.

2. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: January 27, 2016; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel ; 15,000 Gallons (7,500 Gallons each); Harns O ($1.1155 #1 DM &
$0.9866 #2 DM; Howes QG| ($1.1075 #1 DM & $1.0190 #2 DM; Cole's Petrol eum
($1.121189 #1 DM & $1.0315 #2 DM); Stern O ($1.2519 #1 DM & $1.0219 #2 DM ;
CHS, Inc. ($1.2600 #1 DM & $1.0600 #2 DM ; Mdwest O, Mdway Service
(Vollan), and dson Gl, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Harns Q.

3. Report of Requests for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016; Unl eaded Ethanol; 675
Gllons; Stern Gl ($1.3094); Howes Q| and M dway Service, both no bid.
Bid awarded to: Stern Q.

4. Report of Requests for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016; Clear Diesel #1; 581
Gl lons; Stern Gl ($1.5244); Howes Q| and M dway Service, both no bid.
Bid awarded to: Stern Q.

5. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016; E-10
Unl eaded Et hanol /87 Cctane; 8,500 Gallons; Howes GOl ($1.1135); Cole’'s
Petrol eum ($1.1175); Harnms G 1 ($1.1351); Stern O ($1.1454); CHS, Inc.
($1.2200); dson Gl and Mdway (Vollan G l), both no bid. Bid awarded to:
Howes Q| .

6. Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016; 70/30 #2/#1
C ear Diesel Blend; CHS, Inc. ($1.4874); Howes QO ($1.4125); Harns Q|
($1.3867); Mdwest G| and Petrol eum Traders Co., both no bid. Bid awarded
to: Harms Q.

7. Report for Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 1, 2016; d ear
Di esel #2, 581 Gallons; Stern Ol (41.4634); Mdway Service and Howes QO I,
both no bid. Bid awarded to: Stern Q1.

8. A communi cation was received from Debra Rohrer requesting perm ssion to
consune, but not sell, wine and nalt beverages at the Brennan Rock & Roll
Acadeny, 900 W 11th St., on Saturday, March 26, 2016, for a fundraiser.

APPLI CATI ONS

The foll owi ng abatenents were recommended for approval by the Director of
Equal i zation and the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for Mnnehaha County; and the
City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

9. LaVone M Wagner, 1201 N. Dakota Avenue, for 2015 taxes in the anount of
$701. 21.

10. Roger D. Thielsen, 1012 N. Sherman Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $307. 05.



11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

Nancy A. Hansen, 1009 W 7th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the anpunt
of $125. 47.

Lyle W Burrell, Jr., 5508 W 45th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the
anount of $819. 88.

Janet K. Best, 528 N. Shernman Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the anmount
of $49. 30.

Sheila M Fel ker, 1108 W 57th Street, #304, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $257. 48.

Marion Johnson, 5115 E. 22nd Street, for 2015 property taxes in the anpunt
of $495. 85.

Vincent F. Kellar, 2509 W Rice Street, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $765. 30.

Qoria K Spriggs, 1512 S. Riverdal e Road, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $590. 10.

Victoria Raidnme, 916 N. Leadal e Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $741. 36.

Dennis D. Erickson, 804 S. Hawt horne Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $307. 70.

Arl ene Wagner, 7010 W 56th Street, for 2015 property taxes in the anmount
of $509. 68.

Ronni e J. Pekron, 411 S. Holly Avenue, for 2015 property taxes in the
anmount of $694. 44.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

PUBLI C | NPUT

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng



22. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG SECTI ON 124. 012 RAI SI NG SI QUX AREA
METRO PARATRANSI T FARES.

23. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI OUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG A GRANT
OF ELECTRI C TRANSM SSI ON EASEMENT.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

24. A RESOLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE RELEASE OF THE PERMANENT DRAI NAGEWAY EASEMENT
LOCATED IN BLOCK 9, NORTH RIDGE ADDI TION TO THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS,
M NNEHAHA COUNTY, SOUTH DAKCTA.

25. A RESOLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

NEW BUSI NESS

| TEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLI| NE

The City Council may include other such business as may cone before this body.

ADJ OQURNMENT

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOAWN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. WHEN THE CI TY COUNCIL WLL ACT AS A DECI S| ON- MAKER ON AN UPCOM NG
MATTER | N\VOLVI NG A LI CENSE OR A PERM T, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE

WR TTEN COMMENTS TO THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COWWENT AT THE
PUBLI C MEETI NG WHEN THAT | TEM | S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE
WHO PROVI DE COMMENTS | N ANY MANNER SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMMVENTS MAY
BECOME PART OF THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EWBY ALL PARTI ES AND THE
PUBLI C.

ADDRESS| NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM  PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON Cl TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4 P.M COUNCI L COWM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE
FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

| NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NG, CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS Al R LI VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
TH RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7 P.M THE JO NT Cl TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY
COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5 P. M

REGULAR MEETI NGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCH VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR

VI EW NG ON DEMAND ATWAW S| OUXFALLS. ORG. LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON Cl TYLI NK.

Cl TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS AT 1:30 A M AND 9 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6 P.M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COMM TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8 A'M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5 P.M ON SATURDAYS. Cl TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS AT 2:30



AM AND 10 A°M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JO NT CI TY COUNCI L/
M NNEHAHA COUNTY COMM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8 A M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER LI VE
MEETI NG AND 1 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



