| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| Agenda |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
| MEETI NG OF Tuesday, February 10, 2015 at 7: 00 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT

Counci| Menber Dean Karsky

Counci| Menber Rick Kiley

Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers

Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr.

Counci | Menber Christine M Erickson

Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach

Counci| Menber Greg Janison

Mayor M ke T. Huet her

| NVOCATI ON

&#9679; Children’s Pastor Casey Constock, Celebrate Community Church
PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

PROCLAMATI ONS

&#9679; Congenital Heart Defect Awareness Wek - February 7-14, 2015
CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

M NUTES

&#9679; Infornmational Meeting of Mdnday, February 2, 2015, at 4:00 p.m

&#9679; Regular City Council Meeting of Mnday, February 2, 2015, at 7:00 p.m

COVMMUNI CATI ONS



Approval of contracts/agreenents on the February 5, 2015 neno.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: January 29, 2015; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 7,500 gallons (3,750 gallons each #1 & #2); Cole's Petrol eum
($1.8345 #1 & $1.6535 #2); Howes G| ($1.8465 #1 & $1.6555 #2); Harnms QO |
($1.8550 #1 & $1.6720 #2); CHS, Inc. ($1.9424 #1 & $1.7345 #2); Mdwest GOl
and O son G1l, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Cole's Petrol eum

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: January 30, 2015; E-10

Unl eaded Et hanol /87 Cctane; 8,500 gallons; Cole's Petrol eum ($1.5754); Howes
Ol ($1.5765); Harns Ol ($1.5890); CHS, Inc. ($1.6490); A son G, no bid.
Bid awarded to: Cole’'s Petrol eum

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 2, 2015; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 15,000 gallons (7,500 gallons each #1 & #2); Howes QO ($1.9855
#1 & $1.8250 #2); Cole's Petroleum CHS, Inc., Harnms G, Mdwest OI, and
Oson G, all no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes QO |.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: February 4, 2015; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 7,500 gallons (3,750 gallons each #1 & #2); Cole's Petrol eum
($2.0383 #1 & $1.8915 #2); Harms G| ($2.0400 #1 & $1.9075 #2); Howes Q|
($2. 1050 #1 & $1.9050 #2); CHS, Inc., Mdwest Ol and Oson G I, all no bid.
Bid awarded to: Cole’'s Petrol eum

A conmuni cati on was received from Megan Jung and Dustin Jansick requesting
perm ssion to consune, but not sell, beer at the A d Courthouse Miseum 200
W Sixth St., on Saturday, April 25, 2015, from 11:00 a.m wuntil 4:00 p.m

for a wedding reception.

A conmuni cati on was received from Kayl a Chaussee requesting perm ssion to

consunme, but not sell, wine and beer at The O d Courthouse Miseum 200 W

Sixth St., on Saturday, May 9, 2015, from4:00 p.m until 11:59 p.m for a
weddi ng reception.

A conmuni cati on was received fromMchelle Reta requesting permission to
consune, but not sell, beer, wine and |iquor at The Coliseum 515 N. Miin
Ave., on Saturday, August 1, 2015, from5:00 p.m wuntil 11:00 p.m for her
daughter s 15th Birthday - Qui nceanera.

A conmuni cati on was received from N chole Lowe requesting permssion to
consune, but not sell, liquor, wine and nmalt beverages at The A d Courthouse
Museum 200 W Sixth St., on Saturday, Septenber 26, 2015, from5:00 p. m
until 11:00 p.m for a wedding reception.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA



PUBLI C | NPUT

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

10.

11.

12.

Set
for

13.

Set
for

14.

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REPEALI NG
SECTI ONS 95. 085 95. 091 OF THE CODE OF ORDI NANCES COF SAID CI TY BY REPEALI NG
THE SI QUX FALLS | CE AND RECREATI ON CENTER BOARD.

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS AND CLARI FYI NG THE LI M TATI ONS ON EXPENDI TURE
OF FUNDS AND CONTRACTI NG AUTHORI TY FOR CONSTRUCTI ON OF AN | NDOOR AQUATI CS
FACI LI TY AND ASSCCI ATED SI TE | MPROVEMENTS ( THE PRQIECT).

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE APPROVI NG THE SURFACE AMBULANCE SERVI CE FRANCHI SE
AGREEMENT BETWEEN PARAMEDI CS PLUS, LLC AND THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SOUTH
DAKOTA, ALONG W TH AUTHORI ZI NG THE MAYCOR TO SI GN THE SAME.

a date of hearing and 2nd Reading for Tuesday, March 10, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
Item 13:

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF SAID CITY BY CHANG NG A STREET NAME. (West Hanger Street
to West Hangar Street)

a date of hearing and 2nd Reading for Tuesday, March 10, 2015, at 7:00 p.m
Item 14:

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE
OF ORDI NANCES OF SAID CITY BY CHANG NG A STREET NAME. (North John Or Drive
to North Knapp Brown Drive)

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

15.

16.

17.

A RESCLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE RELEASE OF PERMANENT SANI TARY SEWER EASEMENT
LOCATED IN LOT 5 OF THE RESUBDI VI SI ON OF SI QUX FALLS FARMSTEAD I N SECTI ON
25, TOMSHI P 101 NORTH, RANGE 50 WEST OF THE 5TH P. M, M NNEHAHA COUNTY,
SOUTH DAKOTA.

A RESCLUTI ON APPROVI NG THE RELEASE OF A PERVANENT EASEMENT LOCATED I N LOT
7A, BLOCK 10 OF HEATHER RIDGE I, AN ADDI TION TO THE C TY OF SI QUX FALLS,
LI NCCLN COUNTY, SD.

A RESCLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS FOR STREET VACATI ONS

Set

a hearing date for Tuesday, March 10, 2015, at 7:00 p.m for Item 18

t hrough Item 20:

18.

A PROPCSED RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE PUBLI C RI GHT- OF- WAY ON N. NATI ONAL AVE.
FROM THE SOUTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF E. BENSON RD. TO THE NORTH RI GHT- OF-
WAY LINE OF E. 39TH ST. N. AND ON E. HOGAN AVE. FROM THE EAST RI GHT- OF- WAY



LINE OF N. NATI ONAL AVE. TO THE WEST RI GHT- OF-WAY LI NE OF N. CASCO AVE.

19. A PROPGOSED RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE PUBLI C RI GHT- OF-WAY ON S. EUCLI D AVE.
FROM THE SOUTH RI GHT- OF-WAY LINE OF W 22ND ST. TO THE NORTH RI GHT- OF- WAY
LINE OF W 25TH ST.

20. A PROPOSED RESOLUTI ON VACATI NG THE FALLS PARK DR RI GHT- OF- WAY AND THE EAST
ONE- HALF (E1/2) OF THE ALLEY LYI NG ADJACENT TO AND WESTERLY OF SAI D FALLS
PARK DR., ALL LYI NG BETWEEN FALLS PARK DR. AND W 2ND ST.

NEW BUSI NESS

| TEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLI| NE

The City Council may include other such business as may cone before this body.

ADJ OQURNMENT

MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOWN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

AS YOUR ELECTED REPRESENTATI VES, THE Cl TY COUNCI L VALUES YOUR | NPUT AND
FEEDBACK. HOWEVER, THE SOUTH DAKOTA SUPREME COURT HAS RULED THAT Cl TY

COUNCI LORS MAY NOT ENGAGE | N PRI VATE COVMUNI CATI ONS W TH PERSONS WHEN THE CI TY
COUNCI L WLL ACT AS A DECI SI O\ MAKER ON AN UPCOM NG MATTER | NVOLVI NG A LI CENSE
OR A PERM T. I N THOSE | NSTANCES, PERSONS ARE ENCOURAGED TO PROVI DE WRI TTEN
COWENTS TO THE ENTIRE CI TY COUNCI L OR TO PROVI DE ORAL COMVENT AT THE PUBLIC
MEETI NG ON THAT MATTER WHEN | T |'S CONSI DERED BY THE ENTI RE CI TY COUNCI L. THOSE
WHO PROVI DE COMMVENTS SHOULD UNDERSTAND THAT THEI R COMMVENTS W LL BECOVE PART OF
THE OFFI Cl AL RECORD AND SUBJECT TO REVI EW BY ALL PARTI ES AND THE PUBLI C.
ADDRESS| NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM  PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON CI TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4:00 P.M COUNCI L COMM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE
THE FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

| NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NG, CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS Al R LI VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
TH RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7:00 P.M THE JO NT Cl TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COMM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5: 00
P.M REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE Cl TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCHI VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR
VI EW NG ON DEMAND AT WA S| OUXFALLS. ORG LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON Cl TYLI NK.

Cl TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGSAT 1:30 A M AND 9:00 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6:00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COMM TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8:00 A.M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5:00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS
AT 2:30 AM AND 10: 00 A M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7: 00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JONT C TY
COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8:00 A M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER
LI VE MEETING AND 1: 00 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



